

# EXHIBIT C

## Cohen Milstein Sellers &amp; Toll PLLC -- Time Records

Date	Time Keeper	Description	Hours	Reduced Rate	Amount	Code
1/26/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with K. Pierson re issues and fact questions.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	52
1/29/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with K. Pierson and J. Devore re: case and review draft Complaint.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	52
1/30/2009	Joshua Devore	Harder research re: complaint; Meeting with Steve Toll et al re: case	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	52
1/30/2009	Joshua Devore	Review background materials	1.75	\$450	\$787.50	60
1/30/2009	Steven Toll	Meeting with K. Pierson, J. Devore, and H. Adelman.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	52
2/2/2009	Joshua Devore	Correspond with K. Pierson re DWT materials, D. Sommers re staffing; review DWT materials.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	52
2/3/2009	Joshua Devore	Correspond with K. Pierson re DWT materials.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
2/4/2009	Anna Ryon	Conflict of interest research	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52
2/5/2009	Joshua Devore	Review draft complaint.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
2/6/2009	Anna Ryon	Research causes of action; Research re: conflict of interest	9.00	\$275	\$2,475.00	51
2/9/2009	Anna Ryon	Research causes of action	7.00	\$275	\$1,925.00	99
2/10/2009	Anna Ryon	Research causes of action	9.00	\$275	\$2,475.00	51
2/10/2009	Joshua Devore	Review correspondence with K. Pierson re draft complaint.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
2/11/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with J. Devore and K. Pierson re complaint	1.00	\$275	\$275.00	51
2/11/2009	Anna Ryon	Research causes of action	3.75	\$275	\$1,031.25	51
2/11/2009	Joshua Devore	Meeting with K. Pierson and A. Ryon re draft complaint.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	60
2/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with A. Ryon and J. Devore re draft complaint.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
2/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation of complaint.	4.40	\$450	\$1,980.00	51
2/12/2009	Anna Ryon	Draft counts of complaint and research causes of action	6.75	\$275	\$1,856.25	51
2/12/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation of complaint.	2.20	\$450	\$990.00	51
2/12/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Harder factual materials.	2.30	\$450	\$1,035.00	51
2/13/2009	Anna Ryon	Research class action issues and draft complaint	6.75	\$275	\$1,856.25	51
2/13/2009	Joshua Devore	Meeting with K. Pierson and A. Ryon re draft complaint.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	60
2/13/2009	Kit Pierson	Review legal materials re Harder complaint and preparation of complaint.	3.30	\$450	\$1,485.00	51
2/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with H. Adelman re draft complaint.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
2/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Harder factual materials for draft complaint.	1.20	\$450	\$540.00	51
2/17/2009	Joshua Devore	Correspond with K. Pierson, A. Ryon re draft complaint.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
2/17/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Harder factual materials.	1.20	\$450	\$540.00	54
2/19/2009	Joshua Devore	Correspond with K. Pierson, discuss case with A. Ryon.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
2/20/2009	Joshua Devore	Correspondence re retainer agreement draft.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	63
2/21/2009	Joshua Devore	Correspondence re local counsel arrangement.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
2/21/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Harder factual materials in preparation for complaint and drafting Harder Complaint.	7.00	\$450	\$3,150.00	51
2/21/2009	Steven Toll	Review Adelman memo and background materials.	2.75	\$450	\$1,237.50	52
2/22/2009	Kit Pierson	Drafting Harder complaint.	2.50	\$450	\$1,125.00	51
2/23/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with Kit Pierson re: complaint	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	51
2/23/2009	Anna Ryon	Research Oregon pleading standards	2.25	\$275	\$618.75	51
2/23/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with H. Adelman regarding complaint	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
2/23/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Oregon securities law.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51

2/23/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Harder offering materials.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
2/23/2009	Kit Pierson	Drafting Harder complaint; Meeting with A. Ryon re: complaint	2.50	\$450	\$1,125.00	51
2/23/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit Pierson re strategy; review background material and draft Complaint.	2.75	\$450	\$1,237.50	52
2/25/2009	Anna Ryon	Research causes of action	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	51
2/25/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with Josh Devore and Kit Pierson re: complaint	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	51
2/25/2009	Anna Ryon	Research causes of action and edit complaint	3.75	\$275	\$1,031.25	51
2/25/2009	Joshua Devore	Review complaint, edits, discuss with K. Pierson, A. Ryon.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
2/25/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re complaint.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
2/25/2009	Kit Pierson	Review materials re indispensable parties.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
2/25/2009	Kit Pierson	Meetings with A. Ryon and J. Devore re same.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
2/25/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Oregon Securities law issues.	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	51
2/25/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation of Harder complaint.	4.50	\$450	\$2,025.00	51
2/25/2009	Steven Toll	Review and revise draft Complaint.	2.75	\$450	\$1,237.50	51
2/26/2009	Joshua Devore	Review Harder complaint, edits, discuss with K. Pierson.	2.75	\$450	\$1,237.50	51
2/26/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation of Harder complaint and review complaint per comments from Messrs. Devore, Adelman and Fisher.	5.00	\$450	\$2,250.00	51
2/26/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit Pierson and review and revise and finalize Complaint	3.25	\$450	\$1,462.50	51
3/3/2009	Anna Ryon	Review SEC motion for TRO	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52
3/3/2009	Joshua Devore	Review SEC materials	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	52
3/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re post-filing strategy.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
3/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with H. Adelman re same.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
3/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Review SEC complaint, memorandum and materials.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
3/3/2009	Steven Toll	Review SEC Complaint and TRO papers.	1.75	\$450	\$787.50	52
3/3/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Binder creation - all filings in docket up to 3/3/09, speaking with attys about case and assignments	3.75	\$100	\$375.00	54
3/4/2009	Anna Ryon	Review SEC motion for TRO	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
3/4/2009	Steven Toll	Further review articles and SEC filings.	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	52
3/4/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Binder creation - all filings in docket up through 3/3/09	5.50	\$100	\$550.00	54
3/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Review pleadings in parallel State case.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
3/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Review materials re necessary and indispensable parties.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
3/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Harder offering materials.	1.20	\$450	\$540.00	51
3/6/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit Pierson re background issues.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	52
3/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Review materials from SEC litigation.	2.80	\$450	\$1,260.00	51
3/12/2009	Joshua Devore	Call with K. Pierson, J. Fischer re going forward plan.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	60
3/12/2009	Kit Pierson	Review SEC materials; telephone conference with J. Fischer re various issues; call w/Josh Devore re going forward issues.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
3/16/2009	Anna Ryon	Research BR ct's preliminary injunction and receivership order	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52
3/16/2009	Joshua Devore	Review SEC order and Telephone conference with K. Pierson regarding bankruptcy issues.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
3/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Review and send correspondence re various issues.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
3/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Devore re bankruptcy issues.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
3/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Review materials from SEC proceeding.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51

3/17/2009	Kit Pierson	Review factual materials re Harder.	1.60	\$450	\$720.00	51
3/17/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit Pierson re various strategies	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	52
3/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Review SEC materials and depositions.	1.80	\$450	\$810.00	51
3/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Gary Grenley re status of investors he represents, class litigation, etc.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	51
3/18/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Gary Grenley re case issues.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	60
3/19/2009	Anna Ryon	Research requirement of tendering stock to recover damages	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	51
3/19/2009	Joshua Devore	Discuss research with A. Ryon, review memo re damage claims.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	52
3/19/2009	Kit Pierson	Review deposition testimony and correspondence re various issues relating to Harder litigation, bankruptcy, necessary and indispensable party.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
3/26/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Harder factual materials and depositions.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
3/27/2009	Anna Ryon	Review SEC action	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	51
3/27/2009	Kit Pierson	Review and respond to correspondence.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
3/27/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone call J. Fischer re potential plaintiffs; procedural options, etc.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
3/27/2009	Kit Pierson	Review pleadings in related matters.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	51
3/27/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation of projects list.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	51
3/27/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Creating binder of Harder depositions	0.50	\$100	\$50.00	54
3/30/2009	Anna Ryon	Research Oregon class action procedure	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	51
3/30/2009	Anna Ryon	Research related DWT litigation	3.00	\$275	\$825.00	51
3/30/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Binder creation and mailing binder of Harder depositions	0.50	\$100	\$50.00	54
3/30/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Searching fed and state (OR) courts for new filings or cases involving SunWest	3.25	\$100	\$325.00	52
3/31/2009	Anna Ryon	Research Oregon state cases	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	51
3/31/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Searching for electronic dockets in OR state courts	3.25	\$100	\$325.00	52
4/1/2009	Anna Ryon	Research related litigation	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	51
4/1/2009	Anna Ryon	Call with Josh Devore and Kit Pierson to discuss case status	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	51
4/1/2009	Anna Ryon	Document review	3.00	\$275	\$825.00	54
4/1/2009	Joshua Devore	Discussion with A. Ryon and K. Pierson.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	60
4/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Review and respond to correspondence re litigation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
4/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Arellano pleadings.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
4/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Review SEC materials.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
4/1/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Locating and printing depo transcripts of depositions	1.25	\$100	\$125.00	52
4/1/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Searching Oregon District & State Courts for new cases filed against SunWest depositions and for new filings in already active dockets	1.75	\$100	\$175.00	52
4/2/2009	Anna Ryon	Research receivers authority to settle our claims; Research Oregon law on class certification; Discuss case with Josh Devore	3.25	\$275	\$893.75	52
4/2/2009	Joshua Devore	Discuss case with A. Ryon.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	60
4/2/2009	Kit Pierson	Review SEC pleadings.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
4/2/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Harder factual materials.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
4/2/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Harder deposition.	3.00	\$450	\$1,350.00	51
4/2/2009	Kit Pierson	Travel to Oregon.	3.00	\$450	\$1,350.00	68
4/3/2009	Anna Ryon	Call with Kit and local counsel re: case status and strategy.	1.50	\$275	\$412.50	51
4/3/2009	Joshua Devore	Corresp. w/ K. Pierson re Grenley meeting.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
4/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Mr. Arellano.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51

4/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with J. Fischer re status of litigation, going forward strategy.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
4/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Gary Grenley et al. re related developments in bankruptcy proceeding, claims against DWT, class action litigation, etc.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
4/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Harder factual materials & SEC materials; Discussion with Steve Toll re: strategy/staffing	4.50	\$450	\$2,025.00	51
4/3/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit Pierson about strategy and staffing	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	60
4/3/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Searching state and district dockets in OR for new filings, creating chart to track updates	1.75	\$100	\$175.00	52
4/4/2009	Steven Toll	Kit Pierson email and review issues regarding class strategy and Grenley meeting.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	60
4/6/2009	Anna Ryon	Research SEC receiver's authority; Research attorney-client privilege issue; Research language for subpoenas	3.25	\$275	\$893.75	52
4/6/2009	Anna Ryon	Research tender requirement for discovery	3.50	\$275	\$962.50	52
4/6/2009	Joshua Devore	Review correspondence from K. Pierson.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	60
4/6/2009	Kit Pierson	Review of Harder, DWT ad SEC factual materials.	6.00	\$450	\$2,700.00	68
4/7/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with Kit Pierson and Josh Devore re: case status and strategy	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	51
4/7/2009	Anna Ryon	Research SEC receiver's authority; Monitor related litigation	5.75	\$275	\$1,581.25	52
4/7/2009	Joshua Devore	Meet with K. Pierson and A. Ryon regarding case status and strategy.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	60
4/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Review materials from related cases against DWT.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
4/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation of going forward plan.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	60
4/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with J. Devore and A. Ryon regarding going forward strategy/projects.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
4/8/2009	Anna Ryon	Research SEC receiver's authority	2.75	\$275	\$756.25	52
4/8/2009	Joshua Devore	Corresp. re: document database.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	55
4/8/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Searching for new cases against defns and updating docket filings	1.25	\$100	\$125.00	52
4/8/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Sorting through docs received for SunWest, getting vendor quotes for tiffing and ocring, indexing cds, contacting IT about Summation	5.75	\$100	\$575.00	55
4/9/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Handing docs to vendor, giving instructions, answering questions re project	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	55
4/9/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Preparing certs for pro hac motions of SJT, JSD, KAP, AR	1.50	\$100	\$150.00	51
4/10/2009	Anna Ryon	Monitor related litigation	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
4/10/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Updating atty on newly filed cases against defns and newly filed briefs in active cases	2.25	\$100	\$225.00	52
4/13/2009	Anna Ryon	Research receiver authority; Monitor related litigation	6.25	\$275	\$1,718.75	52
4/13/2009	Joshua Devore	Discuss co-counsel arrangement with S. Toll; Email to G. Grenley re: strategy call	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	60
4/13/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Josh Devore; research regarding various legal issues regarding Grenley and Class issues.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	52
4/13/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Received tiffed docs, giving to IT, reviewing docs	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	55
4/13/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Searching active dockets for new filings, updating atty of changes, editing chart format	1.50	\$100	\$150.00	52
4/14/2009	Anna Ryon	Monitor status of related litigation	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
4/14/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with Josh Devore and call Gary Grenley	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	60
4/14/2009	Anna Ryon	Research SEC receiver's authority	1.75	\$275	\$481.25	52
4/14/2009	Joshua Devore	Preparation for call with Grenley re class action litigation.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
4/14/2009	Joshua Devore	Discuss DWT with A. Ryon, discuss DWT documents with A. Ryon, T. Gaffney, T. Carr; email to K. Pierson.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	60

4/14/2009	Joshua Devore	Call w/ Grenley, email re: call summary.	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	60
4/14/2009	Thomas Carr	Creating a database in Summation and importing files.	1.00	\$100	\$100.00	68
4/14/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Arranging for docs to be loaded into Summation, coding docs in database, speaking with atty re next step	2.00	\$100	\$200.00	54
4/15/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Working with docs in Summation	1.25	\$100	\$125.00	54
4/16/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Searching Oregon federal and state courts for related cases and for new filings	1.50	\$100	\$150.00	52
4/17/2009	Anna Ryon	Monitor related litigation	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
4/17/2009	Anna Ryon	Document review	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	54
4/20/2009	Anna Ryon	Document review	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	54
4/20/2009	Anna Ryon	Email Kit Pierson and Josh Devore re: research on tender and receiver	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52
4/20/2009	Anna Ryon	Research receiver authority	2.75	\$275	\$756.25	52
4/20/2009	Joshua Devore	Discuss case with K. Pierson.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
4/20/2009	Joshua Devore	Email re: receiver claims.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
4/20/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Harder factual materials.	2.50	\$450	\$1,125.00	51
4/20/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit Pierson and Josh Devore re various issues on Grenley.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	60
4/21/2009	Anna Ryon	Draft memo on tender requirement for recovery	1.25	\$275	\$343.75	52
4/22/2009	Anna Ryon	Document review	1.00	\$275	\$275.00	54
4/22/2009	Anna Ryon	Research receiver authority	2.25	\$275	\$618.75	52
4/22/2009	Anna Ryon	Draft memo re: tender requirement	3.00	\$275	\$825.00	52
4/22/2009	Kit Pierson	Review cases re attorney liability under Oregon law and review memos re tender of share issues, receivership issue.	2.80	\$450	\$1,260.00	51
4/23/2009	Thomas Carr	Loading the CD's with native files into the database.	2.50	\$100	\$250.00	68
4/23/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Updating OR search chart and emailing Anna Ryon results	0.50	\$100	\$50.00	52
4/23/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Creating index of Summation docs	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	54
4/24/2009	Anna Ryon	Monitor related litigation	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	52
4/24/2009	Anna Ryon	Draft memo on receiver's authority	2.50	\$275	\$687.50	52
4/24/2009	Thomas Carr	Loading the CD's with native files into the database.	3.00	\$100	\$300.00	68
4/27/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with Kit Pierson re: receiver and tender research	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52
4/27/2009	Anna Ryon	Research receiver authority	1.25	\$275	\$343.75	52
4/27/2009	Anna Ryon	Research tender question	1.25	\$275	\$343.75	52
4/27/2009	Anna Ryon	Draft memo re: receivership powers	5.25	\$275	\$1,443.75	52
4/27/2009	Joshua Devore	Corresp. re: scheduling	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
4/27/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Anna Ryon re receivership; review cases/law re same; review Harder fact materials.	2.50	\$450	\$1,125.00	51
4/27/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Searching OR federal and state cases and filings for new updates.	1.25	\$100	\$125.00	52
4/27/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Using Summation to new case documents setting up searches, giving instruction to local counsel.	2.00	\$100	\$200.00	68
4/28/2009	Anna Ryon	Research tender requirement	1.00	\$275	\$275.00	52
4/28/2009	Anna Ryon	Research joinder of necessary parties	2.75	\$275	\$756.25	51
4/28/2009	Anna Ryon	Document review	3.50	\$275	\$962.50	54
4/28/2009	Joshua Devore	Review corresp re case developments.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
4/28/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Setting up Summation and explaining how to use it to local counsel.	1.00	\$100	\$100.00	60
4/29/2009	Anna Ryon	Monitor related litigation	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52

4/29/2009	Anna Ryon	Research how to get investigative testimony from SEC	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	54
4/29/2009	Anna Ryon	Research joinder of necessary parties	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	52
4/29/2009	Anna Ryon	Document review	3.50	\$275	\$962.50	54
4/29/2009	Joshua Devore	Corresp. w/ K. Pierson re co-counsel.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
4/29/2009	Kit Pierson	Review pleadings in SEC litigation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
4/29/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with G. Grenley re class litigation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
4/29/2009	Kit Pierson	Review documents re Harder litigation.	2.60	\$450	\$1,170.00	51
4/29/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Searching Sunwest cases for any new filings.	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	52
4/30/2009	Anna Ryon	Research consolidation of related cases	1.50	\$275	\$412.50	52
4/30/2009	Joshua Devore	Draft fee agreement	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
4/30/2009	Joshua Devore	Meeting w/ Herb Adelman re factual issues; going forward strategy.	1.75	\$450	\$787.50	60
4/30/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Harder documents, review receivership materials.	0.80	\$450	\$360.00	51
4/30/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Herb Adelman, Steve Toll, Josh Devore re DWT strategy, class strategy, Gary Grenley, etc.	1.75	\$450	\$787.50	51
5/1/2009	Anna Ryon	Document review	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	54
5/1/2009	Anna Ryon	Call with Kit Pierson, Josh Devore and Justine Fischer re: case status and schedule	1.00	\$275	\$275.00	51
5/1/2009	Anna Ryon	Research ethics of contacting DWT re: settlement	1.50	\$275	\$412.50	52
5/1/2009	Joshua Devore	Review document requests.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	55
5/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with G. Grenley re class action litigation, pending cases against DWT, etc.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
5/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Arellano re status of class litigation, proposed schedule.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
5/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Correspondence with Arellano re proposed schedule.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
5/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re class action strategic issues.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
5/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Review documents re DWT offerings, etc.	3.10	\$450	\$1,395.00	51
5/4/2009	Anna Ryon	Research ethics of contacting DWT re: settlement	1.75	\$275	\$481.25	52
5/4/2009	Joshua Devore	Sunwest call with K. Pierson re case strategy.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
5/4/2009	Kit Pierson	Review other corr to Judge LeBarre.	0.70	\$450	\$315.00	51
5/4/2009	Kit Pierson	Draft letter to Judge LeBarre re schedule (and other matters relating to status of case).	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
5/4/2009	Kit Pierson	Review DWT offerings/documents.	1.60	\$450	\$720.00	51
5/5/2009	Anna Ryon	Research ethics of contacting DWT re: settlement	2.00	\$275	\$550.00	52
5/5/2009	Anna Ryon	Research joinder of necessary party re: Harder	2.00	\$275	\$550.00	52
5/5/2009	Joshua Devore	Sunwest call with K. Pierson re meeting with Mr. Grenley.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
5/5/2009	Joshua Devore	Sunwest conference call with K. Pierson, G. Grenley re class action strategy.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	60
5/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Review pleadings re Esler DWT litigation.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
5/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Gary Grenley re status of potential claims against DWT, joint involvement in class litigation, Esler cases, securities/class issues presented by class litigation.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
5/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Review DWT offerings/documents.	4.50	\$450	\$2,025.00	51
5/5/2009	Steven Toll	Review Kit Pierson emails; Meeting with G. Grenley	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	60
5/6/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with Josh Devore re: case status and assignments	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	51
5/6/2009	Anna Ryon	Monitor related litigation	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	52
5/6/2009	Anna Ryon	Document review	1.25	\$275	\$343.75	54

5/6/2009	Anna Ryon	Research class certification requirements	2.50	\$275	\$687.50	51
5/6/2009	Joshua Devore	Meeting with A. Ryon re case status, assignments.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
5/6/2009	Joshua Devore	Correspond with K. Pierson re meeting with G. Grenley re DWT.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
5/6/2009	Joshua Devore	Corresp. re: conflict issues, co-counsel agreement, call w/ G. Grenley.	4.50	\$450	\$2,025.00	60
5/6/2009	Kit Pierson	Review fee agreement	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
5/6/2009	Kit Pierson	Correspondence with S. Toll and J. Devore re participation by Grenley firm in class litigation.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
5/6/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with J. Fischer re case.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
5/6/2009	Kit Pierson	Attend status conference w/Judge LeBarre.	1.20	\$450	\$540.00	51
5/6/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation for status conference re Harder litigation.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
5/6/2009	Kit Pierson	Review DWT documents.	2.80	\$450	\$1,260.00	51
5/6/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit and email regarding Grenley participation in class litigation	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	60
5/6/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Teaching summation for use with docs and searching (teaching atty)	0.25	\$100	\$25.00	54
5/6/2009	Tyler Gaffney	updating atty of new filings on new cases related to our action	1.25	\$100	\$125.00	52
5/7/2009	Anna Ryon	Research class certification standards	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	51
5/7/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with Josh Devore and Kit Pierson re: case status	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	51
5/7/2009	Anna Ryon	Document review	1.75	\$275	\$481.25	54
5/7/2009	Anna Ryon	Draft RFP to DWT	3.00	\$275	\$825.00	54
5/7/2009	Joshua Devore	Meeting with K. Pierson , A. Ryon re case status and strategy.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	60
5/8/2009	Anna Ryon	Document review	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	54
5/8/2009	Joshua Devore	Corresp re: co-counsel agreement, edits to agreement	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	60
5/8/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with G. Grenley re class action litigation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	60
5/8/2009	Tyler Gaffney	printing off Summation docs authored by Grates firm	1.50	\$100	\$150.00	68
5/11/2009	Anna Ryon	Locate cases and articles for Kit Pierson	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	52
5/11/2009	Anna Ryon	Edit RFP to DWT	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	54
5/11/2009	Anna Ryon	Research in pare delicto defense for Receiver	1.25	\$275	\$343.75	52
5/11/2009	Joshua Devore	Corresp. with K. Pierson, A. Ryon re: co-counsel agreement.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
5/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Grenley re joint participation in class litigation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
5/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with H. Adelman re review of documents re DWT/Sunwest.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
5/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Review memo re receivership issues and related cases.	2.30	\$450	\$1,035.00	51
5/11/2009	Tyler Gaffney	coding docs in Summation, meeting with local counsel to print docs	2.25	\$100	\$225.00	54
5/12/2009	Anna Ryon	Monitor related litigation	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
5/12/2009	Anna Ryon	Document review	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	54
5/12/2009	Anna Ryon	Research revised complaint	2.25	\$275	\$618.75	51
5/12/2009	Kit Pierson	Review receivership cases; review client materials & preparation for meeting with client; Review document requests	5.50	\$450	\$2,475.00	51
5/12/2009	Tyler Gaffney	OR searches for updated filing in dockets related to the Sunwest case	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	52
5/13/2009	Joshua Devore	Sunwest correspondence re: RFPs.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	55
5/13/2009	Joshua Devore	Edits to RFP	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	55
5/13/2009	Joshua Devore	Review document request.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	55
5/13/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with client and review materials re same.	3.50	\$450	\$1,575.00	63
5/13/2009	Tyler Gaffney	OR searches for newly filed cases	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	52
5/14/2009	Anna Ryon	Document review	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	54



5/14/2009	Anna Ryon	Research amended complaint	4.25	\$275	\$1,168.75	51
5/14/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Grenley re class litigation, facts re Sunwest.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
5/14/2009	Kit Pierson	Review receivership materials.	3.00	\$450	\$1,350.00	51
5/15/2009	Anna Ryon	Research discovery coordination order	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
5/15/2009	Anna Ryon	Document review	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	54
5/15/2009	Anna Ryon	Call with Kit Pierson and Josh Devore re: Grenley meeting and DWT facts	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	51
5/15/2009	Anna Ryon	Research whether unnamed putative class members are represented parties	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52
5/15/2009	Anna Ryon	Research amended complaint	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	51
5/15/2009	Anna Ryon	Draft motion to intervene	5.00	\$275	\$1,375.00	51
5/15/2009	Joshua Devore	Calls with K. Pierson, re Grenley meeting and DWT facts, discuss same with A. Ryon.	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	60
5/15/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with G. Grenley et al. re class litigation, facts/strategy re Sunwest & DWT.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
5/15/2009	Kit Pierson	Review receivership materials/cases.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
5/15/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Searching for new related cases and new filings in related dockets	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	52
5/17/2009	Kit Pierson	Review receivership materials.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	54
5/17/2009	Kit Pierson	Drafting document request.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
5/18/2009	Anna Ryon	Revise motion to intervene in SEC action	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	51
5/18/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with Kit re: expedited appeal process	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	51
5/18/2009	Anna Ryon	Draft document in support of motion to intervene in SEC action	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	51
5/18/2009	Anna Ryon	Pro hac vice Federal District Oregon	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	51
5/18/2009	Anna Ryon	Serve RFP to DWT	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	54
5/18/2009	Anna Ryon	Research expedited appeals process	2.00	\$275	\$550.00	51
5/18/2009	Anna Ryon	Research whether unnamed putative class members are represented parties	2.75	\$275	\$756.25	52
5/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Messrs. Grenley & Dean re receiver issues.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
5/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conferences with David Dean and client	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
5/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Review RFP to Defendants.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
5/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparing intervention papers re receivership/third party claims.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
5/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Review cases re Receivership powers; telephone call w/ S. Toll re: same	4.00	\$450	\$1,800.00	51
5/18/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit regarding Receiver issues and related research	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	52
5/18/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Pulling filings from the sec and bankruptcy case dockets and printing for local counsel	3.25	\$100	\$325.00	52
5/19/2009	Anna Ryon	Prepare pro hac vice for Federal District Oregon	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	51
5/19/2009	Anna Ryon	Research re: additional class plaintiffs	3.75	\$275	\$1,031.25	52
5/19/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Receiver's counsel re their plan re third party claims.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
5/19/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re same.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
5/19/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Grenley & Dean re receivership, additional plaintiffs, etc.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
5/19/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with H. Adelman re receivership issues.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
5/19/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation of intervention memo and related papers.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
5/19/2009	Kit Pierson	Review research from A. Ryon re appeal options, issues re class conflicts.	2.50	\$450	\$1,125.00	51
5/19/2009	Kit Pierson	Review law re same.	3.40	\$450	\$1,530.00	51
5/20/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation of intervention papers.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
5/20/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with G. Grenley re: intervention	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
5/20/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Grenley drafts re Receiver's proposal re third party claims.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51

5/20/2009	Kit Pierson	Review receivership materials/cases.	3.00	\$450	\$1,350.00	51
5/20/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation of objections to receivership's proposal to act on behalf of third parties.	5.50	\$450	\$2,475.00	51
5/20/2009	Tyler Gaffney	searching for newly filed related cases	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	52
5/21/2009	Joshua Devore	Review correspondence, email to K. Pierson.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
5/21/2009	Karen Handorf	Research appealability of proposed order regarding third party claims.	9.75	\$450	\$4,387.50	52
5/21/2009	Kit Pierson	Review materials re appellate review of decision re Receivership powers.	0.80	\$450	\$360.00	51
5/21/2009	Kit Pierson	Review of legal materials and preparation of opposition to Receiver's Proposed Order.	8.00	\$450	\$3,600.00	51
5/21/2009	Tyler Gaffney	printing docs from Summation, fixing troubles with database	3.75	\$100	\$375.00	54
5/22/2009	Joshua Devore	Review filings	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
5/22/2009	Karen Handorf	Research applicability of order regarding third party claims.	6.50	\$450	\$2,925.00	52
5/22/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Summation printing	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	54
5/25/2009	Joshua Devore	Review draft objection to proposed order re Receiver.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
5/25/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with H. Adelman re same.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
5/25/2009	Kit Pierson	Review materials re new plaintiffs.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
5/25/2009	Kit Pierson	Review case law re issues raised by Receiver, including constitutional issues and grounds for appeal.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
5/25/2009	Kit Pierson	Drafting opposition memorandum re: proposed order re: third party claims	5.00	\$450	\$2,250.00	51
5/26/2009	Joshua Devore	Emails w/K. Pierson, A. Ryon re case status.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
5/26/2009	Kit Pierson	Review case law re issues raised by Receiver and preparing opposition memorandum.	9.50	\$450	\$4,275.00	51
5/26/2009	Steven Toll	Review and revise draft papers in opposition to Receiver's proposed Notice and Order.	2.25	\$450	\$1,012.50	51
5/26/2009	Thomas Carr	Entering proper bated numbers in the database	3.00	\$100	\$300.00	68
5/26/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Summation printing	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	54
5/26/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Researching new cases and updating new filings	1.00	\$100	\$100.00	52
5/27/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with S Toll re receivership issues.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
5/27/2009	Kit Pierson	Review case law re issues raised by Receiver and preparing opposition memorandum.	6.60	\$450	\$2,970.00	51
5/27/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with H. Adelman re Receivership objections and related issues.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	51
5/27/2009	Thomas Carr	Entering proper bated numbers in the database	5.00	\$100	\$500.00	68
5/27/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Preparation of Summation database for case	5.00	\$100	\$500.00	54
5/27/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Creating chart with info on various already filed cases - IL/Minn/FL	5.50	\$100	\$550.00	52
5/28/2009	Anna Ryon	Research whether federal court can stay state court litigation	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	51
5/28/2009	Joshua Devore	Review order on receiver	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
5/28/2009	Joshua Devore	Corresp w/ T. Gaffney, K. Pierson re documents.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
5/28/2009	Joshua Devore	Review corresp. w/ A. Ryon	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
5/28/2009	Joshua Devore	Meeting with K. Pierson regarding going forward with work.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	60
5/28/2009	Joshua Devore	Review retainer, contingency agreement, emails to K. Pierson.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	63
5/28/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with former SEC official re Receivership powers/actions, support for class actions, etc.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
5/28/2009	Kit Pierson	Correspondence re Receivership issues and meeting J. Devore re going forward work.	1.40	\$450	\$630.00	51
5/28/2009	Thomas Carr	Entering proper bated numbers in the database	3.00	\$100	\$300.00	68
5/28/2009	Tyler Gaffney	searching for new cases related to SunWest management	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	52

5/29/2009	Amos Presler	Corresponded with Anna Ryon about research for Sunwest issue; research on anti-injunction statute and issue litigation stays requested by a receiver.	3.75	\$200	\$750.00	52
5/29/2009	Anna Ryon	Draft response to RFPs	3.75	\$275	\$1,031.25	54
5/29/2009	Anna Ryon	Research receiver enjoining investor suits	1.50	\$275	\$412.50	52
5/29/2009	Joshua Devore	Research re Receiver powers.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	52
5/29/2009	Joshua Devore	Corresp re research re Receiver powers.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	52
5/29/2009	Joshua Devore	Edits to document request response.	1.75	\$450	\$787.50	55
5/29/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with SEC attorney (Fickes) re Harder.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
5/29/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Harder complaint.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
6/1/2009	Amos Presler	Met with Kit Pierson re receivership issues.	0.50	\$200	\$100.00	51
6/1/2009	Amos Presler	Researched authority of receiver in Sunwest case.	6.75	\$200	\$1,350.00	52
6/1/2009	Anna Ryon	Serve response to RFPs	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	54
6/1/2009	Anna Ryon	Revise response to DWT's first RFPs	2.75	\$275	\$756.25	54
6/1/2009	Anna Ryon	Research receiver authority to enter injunction	4.00	\$275	\$1,100.00	52
6/1/2009	Joshua Devore	Response to DWT's request for production, discussion with A. Ryon.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	55
6/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Draft letter to Judge Velure.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
6/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Revising response to DWT request for production.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
6/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with A. Pressler regarding receivership issues.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
6/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Review cases receivership/stays of third party cases.	2.20	\$450	\$990.00	51
6/1/2009	Steven Toll	Review mediation letter and materials regarding intervention regarding Receiver	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	55
6/2/2009	Amos Presler	Met with Kit Pierson and Anna Ryon	0.25	\$200	\$50.00	52
6/2/2009	Amos Presler	Researched bankruptcy court's jurisdiction for injunctions against 3rd party litigation	1.50	\$200	\$300.00	52
6/2/2009	Amos Presler	Continued research on authority of receiver in Sunwest and drafted argument against a litigation stay.	7.00	\$200	\$1,400.00	52
6/2/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with Amos Presler re: receiver research	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
6/2/2009	Anna Ryon	Serve hard copy of RFP responses	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	54
6/2/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with Kit Pierson and Amos Presler re: research results receiver injunction	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52
6/2/2009	Anna Ryon	Research receiver authority to enter injunction	1.25	\$275	\$343.75	52
6/2/2009	Anna Ryon	Review Amos' memo on receiver research	1.25	\$275	\$343.75	52
6/2/2009	Joshua Devore	Review filings	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
6/2/2009	Kit Pierson	Review documents relating to new class plaintiffs.	2.80	\$450	\$1,260.00	51
6/2/2009	Kit Pierson	Review cases re receivership powers and representation of investors.	3.00	\$450	\$1,350.00	51
6/2/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Assembling binder of cases/pldgs for KAP at hearing and researching new cases	2.75	\$100	\$275.00	52
6/3/2009	Anna Ryon	Research defenses applicable to receiver	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52
6/3/2009	Anna Ryon	Monitor related litigation	0.75	\$275	\$206.25	52
6/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with G. Grenley re class action litigation.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
6/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Attending mediation with Judge Velure et al.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
6/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Review receivership cases/pleadings.	4.50	\$450	\$2,025.00	51
6/3/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit regarding office support issues and mediation	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	52
6/3/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Pulling pldgs and faxing to Kit Pierson	0.25	\$100	\$25.00	52
6/4/2009	Anna Ryon	Monitor related litigation	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
6/4/2009	Joshua Devore	Call with K. Pierson re mediation work.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60

6/4/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conferences and correspondence re mediation work and review materials re new potential plaintiffs.	1.80	\$450	\$810.00	51
6/5/2009	Anna Ryon	Monitor related litigation	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
6/5/2009	Joshua Devore	Review correspondence re: mediation/settlement	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
6/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fisher re mediation	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
6/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Peter Benvenuti re DWT litigation, settlement prospects, etc.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
6/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Steve Walters re mediation of DWT claims.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
6/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Review draft order from Steve Walters and edit same.	0.70	\$450	\$315.00	51
6/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation for calls re: mediation/settlement, status of case	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
6/5/2009	Steven Toll	Emails regarding settlement.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	58
6/5/2009	Tyler Gaffney	meeting to re-evaluate searching for new cases; performing new search	1.00	\$100	\$100.00	52
6/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Editing proposed order re mediation.	0.60	\$450	\$270.00	51
6/8/2009	Kit Pierson	Drafting amended complaint and review materials from additional plaintiffs.	3.40	\$450	\$1,530.00	51
6/9/2009	Amos Presler	Discussed receiver and court's jurisdiction over state claims with Anna Ryon	0.25	\$200	\$50.00	52
6/9/2009	Anna Ryon	Research receiver's authority to seek injunction	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
6/9/2009	Anna Ryon	Monitor related litigation	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
6/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Review correspondence re mediation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
6/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with client re case status/document review.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
6/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Reviewing materials from new plaintiffs and preparing amended complaint.	3.30	\$450	\$1,485.00	51
6/9/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Searching for related cases and updating status of cases	0.50	\$100	\$50.00	52
6/9/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Setting up travel plans to Oregon for doc prod	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	68
6/10/2009	Amos Presler	Reviewed research on Sunwest and looked for caselaw on enjoining different state law claims	3.25	\$200	\$650.00	52
6/10/2009	Joshua Devore	Review proposed order	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
6/10/2009	Joshua Devore	Review correspondence, discuss mediation with K. Pierson.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
6/10/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with S. English re mediation.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
6/10/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re same; discuss mediation with J. Devore.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
6/10/2009	Kit Pierson	Review materials from new plaintiffs and drafting amended complaint.	4.80	\$450	\$2,160.00	51
6/10/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Confirming travel plans to OR	0.25	\$100	\$25.00	68
6/11/2009	Amos Presler	Outlined memo on Sunwest receiver's authority to enjoin state claims	1.50	\$200	\$300.00	52
6/11/2009	Anna Ryon	Research receiver authority to enjoin state litigation	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52
6/11/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit Pierson; email exchanges regarding mediation	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	58
6/12/2009	Amos Presler	Meeting with Kit Pierson and Anna Ryon about receiver and upcoming mediation.	1.00	\$200	\$200.00	51
6/12/2009	Amos Presler	Drafting memo on receiver-court's authority to enjoin state claims.	4.00	\$200	\$800.00	52
6/12/2009	Anna Ryon	Research filing of waiver of service	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	51
6/12/2009	Anna Ryon	Prepare for meeting with Kit re: research and discovery	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
6/12/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with Tyler re: document review in Oregon	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	54
6/12/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with Kit Pierson and Amos Presler re: receiver research	1.00	\$275	\$275.00	52
6/12/2009	Joshua Devore	Corresp re: case theory with K. Pierson, A. Ryon.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
6/12/2009	Kit Pierson	Review DWT RFP's to Plaintiff	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
6/12/2009	Kit Pierson	Email correspondence with J. Fischer, G. Grenley, etc. re mediation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
6/12/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with T. Gaffney and A. Ryon re Kurtz production and Receivership issues.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51

6/12/2009	Kit Pierson	Review materials from Broker (Wielde).	1.30	\$450	\$585.00	51
6/12/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit regarding case update and strategy.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
6/12/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Researching new related cases, updating status of related cases	0.50	\$100	\$50.00	52
6/12/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Meeting with attys regarding doc prod assignment, preparation for document review, printing contact info, doc request.	4.25	\$100	\$425.00	68
6/13/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with H. Adelman & J. Fischer re receivership issues, proposed mediation, demand letter, etc.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
6/14/2009	Amos Presler	Reviewed caselaw on receivers and injunctions.	3.00	\$200	\$600.00	52
6/15/2009	Amos Presler	Drafted commentary on receiver/injunction caselaw for K. Pierson	2.50	\$200	\$500.00	52
6/15/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Steve English re same.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
6/15/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with J. Fischer re mediation/receivership issues.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
6/15/2009	Kit Pierson	Attending Harder mediation meeting with Judge Velure, et al.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
6/15/2009	Kit Pierson	Review documents re new plaintiffs.	3.50	\$450	\$1,575.00	51
6/15/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Traveling to OR for client doc collection	12.00	\$100	\$1,200.00	68
6/16/2009	Amos Presler	Research anti-injunction act and drafted follow-up memo to K. Pierson.	6.00	\$200	\$1,200.00	52
6/16/2009	Anna Ryon	Coordinate document production with Tyler	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	54
6/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Justine Fisher re class action strategy/mediation.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
6/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Gary Grenley re same.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
6/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Review documents re DWT.	3.80	\$450	\$1,710.00	51
6/16/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Collecting hard copy investment docs from clients (Dan and Sydney Kurtz)	9.00	\$100	\$900.00	54
6/17/2009	Amos Presler	Research on unresolved issues in anti-injunction memo.	8.00	\$200	\$1,600.00	52
6/17/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Osias proposal re mediation; corr with Fisher/Grenley re same; telephone conference with J. Fisher re same; correspondence with Osias, Walters, Fisher, Grenley, English re mediation issues.	1.80	\$450	\$810.00	51
6/17/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Collecting emails from clients for doc request	9.00	\$100	\$900.00	54
6/18/2009	Amos Presler	Preparation of Sunwest/injunction memo and discussed with A. Ryon.	5.00	\$200	\$1,000.00	52
6/18/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with Amos Presler re: receiver research	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
6/18/2009	Anna Ryon	Research extent of liability for participation in fraud (K&K Gates exposure)	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
6/18/2009	Anna Ryon	Edit memo on receiver and injunction	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52
6/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re schedule in state case.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
6/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Arellano re same, insurance etc.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
6/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Draft demand letter to Arellano.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
6/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Review cases re enjoining parallel state proceedings.	2.30	\$450	\$1,035.00	51
6/18/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit regarding status; review revised Order.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
6/18/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Collecting docs from client's accountant, copying, shipping, saving client emails	7.00	\$100	\$700.00	54
6/19/2009	Amos Presler	Organized hard copy and electronic underlying research for Sunwest, spoke with K. Pierson; spoke with A. Ryon re same.	2.50	\$200	\$500.00	52
6/19/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Fischer re schedule.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
6/19/2009	Kit Pierson	Draft proposed schedule.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
6/19/2009	Kit Pierson	Review DWT documents.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
6/19/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Dan Sigelman regarding case status.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	55
6/19/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Travel back from OR, retrieving client docs	10.00	\$100	\$1,000.00	68
6/22/2009	Anna Ryon	Meet with Kit re: case status	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	51

6/22/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed Declaration of Michael E. Liftik in support of Plaintiff SEC's ex part application for temporary restraining order and order to show cause re: preliminary injunction.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
6/22/2009	Dan Sigelman	Searched for and reviewed proposed Order Temporarily Authorizing Receiver to Participate in Mediation of Claims Held by Investors Against Third Persons on Behalf of Investors Not Currently Represented by Other Counsel.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
6/22/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed Memorandum by D. Kurtz's Canyon Crest, LLC, et al., Objecting to Receiver's Proposed "Order Authorizing Receiver to Participate in Litigation and Mediation of Claims Held by Investors Against Third Parties on Behalf of Investors Not Currently Rep	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
6/22/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed SEC complaint.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
6/22/2009	Dan Sigelman	Conversation with Kit Pierson re: the various parties and their counsel involved in the litigation.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	60
6/22/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed summary of Harder's testimony to the SEC.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
6/22/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed First Amended Class Action Complaint for Oregon Securities Law Damages.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
6/22/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed exhibits to the Declaration of Michael E. Liftik in support of Plaintiff SEC's ex part application for temporary restraining order and order to show cause re: preliminary injunction.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
6/22/2009	Joshua Devore	Review corresp.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
6/22/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re mediation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
6/22/2009	Kit Pierson	Review documents/materials re DWT.	1.30	\$450	\$585.00	51
6/22/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Search for related cases, monitoring report	0.25	\$100	\$25.00	52
6/22/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Monitoring report of cases against Petter's funds	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	52
6/23/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed Order Denying Motion for Preliminary Injunction in Kraus and emailed Kit Pierson concerning implicit admission by defendants referenced in a footnote of this opinion that they engaged in improper intra-company as alleged by Kraus.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
6/23/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed SEC deposition of Harder.	2.50	\$450	\$1,125.00	51
6/23/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed exhibits to the Declaration of Michael E. Liftik in support of Plaintiff SEC's ex part application for temporary restraining order and order to show cause re: preliminary injunction.	3.75	\$450	\$1,687.50	51
6/23/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Organizing client docs & entering emails into system/copying to cd	1.25	\$100	\$125.00	54
6/24/2009	Amos Presler	Reviewing caselaw on debtor estate property and insurance	3.50	\$200	\$700.00	52
6/24/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed Complaint in Grassmueck v. Davis Wright Tremaine LLP.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
6/24/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed SEC deposition of Harder.	7.75	\$450	\$3,487.50	51
6/24/2009	Kit Pierson	Review DWT documents.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
6/25/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed SEC deposition of Michael J. Deines.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
6/25/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed SEC deposition of Harder.	6.75	\$450	\$3,037.50	51
6/25/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with class plaintiff	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
6/25/2009	Kit Pierson	Drafting amended complaint and review DWT documents.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
6/26/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed SEC deposition of Harder.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
6/26/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Searching for related cases & monitoring report	0.25	\$100	\$25.00	52
6/29/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Copying & assembling binder on receivership rights	1.75	\$100	\$175.00	68

6/30/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with class plaintiff re status of litigation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
7/1/2009	Anna Ryon	Monitor related litigation	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
7/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Review RICO law re directing enterprise; nature of enterprise.	1.80	\$450	\$810.00	51
7/2/2009	Anna Ryon	Monitor related litigation	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
7/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Correspond with J. Fischer re case management issues	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
7/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with S. Walters re case management issues.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
7/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Wielde documents re DWT.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
7/6/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Wielde documents.	2.20	\$450	\$990.00	51
7/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Steve Walters et al re case management.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
7/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Judge Velure re mediation/3P claims.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
7/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Review client documents/materials for name plaintiffs.	2.50	\$450	\$1,125.00	51
7/8/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with J. Fischer re mediation, going forward plans.	0.80	\$450	\$360.00	60
7/8/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with G. Grenley re ongoing receivership proceedings, mediation, etc.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
7/8/2009	Tyler Gaffney	updating docket tracking report	0.25	\$100	\$25.00	52
7/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Prepare projects list for Harder mediation/discovery.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
7/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Identify DWT employees for depositions.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
7/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Wielde documents.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
7/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Receiver law firm complaints.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	51
7/10/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with S. Walters re discovery projects/coordinating discovery.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
7/10/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Wielde documents.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
7/13/2009	Joshua Devore	Review correspondence.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
7/13/2009	Kit Pierson	Draft letter to J. LeBarre re case schedule and corresp. with Kepler re same.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
7/13/2009	Kit Pierson	Review index of DWT files and review individual client materials re DWT.	1.80	\$450	\$810.00	51
7/14/2009	Kit Pierson	Corresp. with Grenley, J. Fischer re mediation, documents.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
7/14/2009	Kit Pierson	Corresp. with Keeper; finalizing letter to J. LeBarre.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
7/15/2009	Dan Sigelman	Discussed the status of the case with Kit Pierson.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
7/15/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed SEC deposition of Jon Michael Harder.	7.00	\$450	\$3,150.00	51
7/15/2009	Kit Pierson	Review documents/materials from clients re Harder.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
7/16/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed SEC deposition of Harder.	8.00	\$450	\$3,600.00	51
7/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Walters re Harder facts, discover, deposition plans.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
7/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Wielde documents.	2.60	\$450	\$1,170.00	51
7/17/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed SEC deposition of Harder.	4.00	\$450	\$1,800.00	51
7/17/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Harder client documents; Wielde documents.	2.50	\$450	\$1,125.00	51
7/18/2009	Joshua Devore	Review filings	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
7/20/2009	Kit Pierson	Review client documents and Wielde documents.	2.80	\$450	\$1,260.00	51
7/21/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Updating docket information of related cases	0.25	\$100	\$25.00	52
7/23/2009	Kit Pierson	Correspond with Walters re discovery issues/mediation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
7/23/2009	Kit Pierson	Review client documents and Wielde documents.	2.30	\$450	\$1,035.00	51
7/23/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Updating docket monitoring	0.25	\$100	\$25.00	52
7/24/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with S. Walters re mediation/discovery coordination.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
7/24/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Vacura re document review;	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
7/24/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Wielde documents.	4.30	\$450	\$1,935.00	51
7/27/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed files produced by the representative plaintiffs.	4.00	\$450	\$1,800.00	54

7/27/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Gathering, copying, assembling analyst reports, conf call transcripts	2.50	\$100	\$250.00	52
7/28/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with S Walters re discovery plans and correspondence re same.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
7/28/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Wiehle materials.	2.20	\$450	\$990.00	51
7/29/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed files produced by the representative plaintiffs.	6.25	\$450	\$2,812.50	51
7/29/2009	Thomas Carr	Loading documents into the database.	2.00	\$100	\$200.00	68
7/29/2009	Tyler Gaffney	reviewing disks and sending to IT for upload to Summation	2.25	\$100	\$225.00	54
7/30/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed Kurtz emails.	3.50	\$450	\$1,575.00	54
7/30/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed files produced by the representative plaintiffs.	4.25	\$450	\$1,912.50	51
7/30/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with S Clarke re investigation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	60
7/31/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with J. Fischer re mediation and discovery issues, documents from plaintiffs, Grenley, etc.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
7/31/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Walters, Vicura, Larkins, Yugler re factual development, mediation strategy, discovery strategy.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
7/31/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation for meetings re: factual development, discovery strategy, and mediation strategy	2.50	\$450	\$1,125.00	51
7/31/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Reviewing docs in database	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	52
8/3/2009	Dan Sigelman	Met with Kit Pierson to discuss projects to undertake involving review of offering statements received on CDs as well as communications between Davis Wright Tremaine and our clients.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
8/3/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Pulling tagged docs from summation	3.00	\$100	\$300.00	54
8/4/2009	Dan Sigelman	Meeting with Kit Pierson and Tyler Gaffney re: project to list, describe and print out offering memoranda (to be listed by subject properties, dates, law firms and lawyers involved).	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
8/4/2009	Dan Sigelman	Came up with terms to be used in an OCR search of DWT's emails, and emailed Kit Pierson with a list of same.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
8/4/2009	Kit Pierson	Review DWT documents.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
8/4/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conf. with H. Adelman re mediation, going forward strategy, etc.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	51
8/4/2009	Kit Pierson	Correspondence with D. Sigelman re search terms; prepare/provide list of search terms for DWT email to J. Vacura.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	51
8/4/2009	Thomas Carr	Import, OCR, and load documents.	3.00	\$100	\$300.00	68
8/4/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Loading cds into database and pulling tagged docs	4.75	\$100	\$475.00	54
8/5/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed Sunwest Gates law firm offerings.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
8/5/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed DWT billings records in Concordance.	3.50	\$450	\$1,575.00	51
8/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Review client records.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
8/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Review DWT documents.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
8/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Drafting/editing discovery requests and review requests from parallel litigation.	1.80	\$450	\$810.00	51
8/5/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Locating offering memoranda and risk factors section for Sunwest offerings	4.75	\$100	\$475.00	54
8/6/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed DWT billing records in Concordance.	8.00	\$450	\$3,600.00	51
8/6/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation of discovery requests and review materials re initial disclosures.	1.20	\$450	\$540.00	51
8/6/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Creating chart of all offering memos by date & author	5.00	\$100	\$500.00	52



8/7/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed Gates offerings for risk factor language warning that the sponsor of projects may commingle funds which, in the event of insolvency or other circumstances, constitutes a risk for investors.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
8/7/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed document furnished by Richard Wiede for communications from DWT lawyers.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
8/7/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed documents received from class representatives for communications with DWT lawyers and other personnel.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
8/7/2009	Dan Sigelman	Began focused search for documents in these records containing certain potentially relevant search terms.	2.75	\$450	\$1,237.50	51
8/7/2009	Dan Sigelman	Completed initial review of DWT billing records in Concordance.	3.00	\$450	\$1,350.00	51
8/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Prepare projects/game plan for next 4-6 weeks.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
8/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Finalizing discovery requests; corresp. re same.	1.80	\$450	\$810.00	51
8/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Review DWT documents.	1.90	\$450	\$855.00	51
8/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting w/D Sigelman re status of case and projects in August.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	51
8/7/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit regarding status of case	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
8/7/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Updating docket tracking chart	0.25	\$100	\$25.00	52
8/7/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Continue creating offering memoranda chart	5.50	\$100	\$550.00	52
8/8/2009	Dan Sigelman	Searched for references to Masters and K&L Gates in the context of the offering memoranda DWT had drafted to be sent to TIC investors.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
8/8/2009	Dan Sigelman	Searched for documents in Concordance database for DWT billing records pertaining to securities law concerns, particularly those voiced by attorney R. Gibson Masters of K&L Gates.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
8/10/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted global issues in the litigation to be used in preparation for the depositions of DWT attorneys.	3.25	\$450	\$1,462.50	51
8/10/2009	Dan Sigelman	Did targeted term searches of DWT billing records for documents relating to an extensive list of items, including those applicable to class representatives and to key terms reflecting and/or describing activities at issue in the litigation.	5.00	\$450	\$2,250.00	51
8/10/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Arranging for upload of docs to concordance database (defns' production)	1.75	\$100	\$175.00	54
8/11/2009	Dan Sigelman	Did targeted term searches of DWT billing records for documents relating to an extensive list of items.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
8/11/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed and highlighted by potential deposition issue selected DWT billing records that were printed out.	5.75	\$450	\$2,587.50	51
8/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Correspond with Walters, Larkin etc re mediation issues.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
8/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with David Dean re DWT documents, status of receivership issues & distribution of funds.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
8/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting w/Dan Sigelman re deposition preparation/document review.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
8/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Review proposed Reorganization.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
8/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with G. Grenley et al re reorganization	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
8/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Review summary re same.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
8/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Review DWT file index for relevant materials	0.60	\$450	\$270.00	51
8/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Review memo re receivership standing/issues.	1.40	\$450	\$630.00	51
8/11/2009	Steven Toll	Review SEC Preliminary Injunction papers	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
8/11/2009	Thomas Carr	Importing files, OCRing, and loading	4.00	\$100	\$400.00	68

8/11/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Updating docket tracking chart	0.50	\$100	\$50.00	52
8/12/2009	Dan Sigelman	Discussions with IT specialist Thomas Carr regarding the possibility of putting email production into OCR format.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
8/12/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed and highlighted and segregated by potential deposition issue selected DWT billing records that were printed out.	7.75	\$450	\$3,487.50	51
8/12/2009	Kit Pierson	Review proposed Distribution Plan.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
8/12/2009	Thomas Carr	Importing in documents	2.50	\$100	\$250.00	68
8/13/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed documents from additional discs received.	2.75	\$450	\$1,237.50	51
8/13/2009	Joyce Zhu	Sunwest Management research.	3.00	\$100	\$300.00	52
8/13/2009	Kit Pierson	Review proposed Receivership plans; corr w/Walters, Osias, etc. re same.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
8/13/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Wiede documents.	1.20	\$450	\$540.00	51
8/13/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Training paralegal to complete offering memoranda chart, continuing chart completion	6.00	\$100	\$600.00	52
8/14/2009	Joyce Zhu	Sunwest Management Research.	5.00	\$100	\$500.00	52
8/14/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with P Connolly re same.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
8/14/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re receivership/third party claims.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
8/14/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Osias, Walters, et al. re same.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
8/14/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Receivership/Distribution plan.	1.90	\$450	\$855.00	51
8/14/2009	Steven Toll	Review SEC PI papers and letters regarding settlement	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	58
8/14/2009	Tyler Gaffney	identifying authors of offering memoranda and completing chart	7.00	\$100	\$700.00	52
8/17/2009	Dan Sigelman	Detailed review and comparison of the panoply of risks enumerated over time in Offering Memoranda DWT drafted for some of the representative plaintiffs (including Kurtz's Canyon Crest, LLC, Hiebert's Brookside, LLC, Allen's Englewood Heights, LLC, and Dun	8.00	\$450	\$3,600.00	51
8/17/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with G. Grenley.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
8/17/2009	Kit Pierson	Email to D. Osias regarding same.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
8/17/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference regarding same with J. Fischer	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
8/17/2009	Kit Pierson	Review proposed distribution plan.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
8/18/2009	Dan Sigelman	Detailed review and comparison of the panoply of risks enumerated over time in Offering Memoranda DWT drafted for some of the representative plaintiffs (including Kurtz's Cottage Village, LLC; Maplewood, LLC; and Kurtz's Richland Pines, LLC).	2.50	\$450	\$1,125.00	51
8/18/2009	Dan Sigelman	Began reviewing Offering Memoranda contained in the first of two binders that were drafted and issued from 2005 on for provisions added or changed relating to the matters at issue in plaintiffs' allegations.	5.00	\$450	\$2,250.00	51
8/18/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Chart update of all DWT PPM's	0.50	\$100	\$50.00	52
8/18/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Database search for additional offering memoranda	1.25	\$100	\$125.00	52
8/19/2009	Dan Sigelman	Began review of Offering Memoranda contained in the second binder.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
8/19/2009	Dan Sigelman	Completed review of Offering Memoranda contained in the first of two binders that were drafted and issued from 2005 on for provisions added or changed relating to the matters at issue in plaintiffs' allegations.	5.25	\$450	\$2,362.50	51
8/19/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Searching database for POMES and offering memos, organizing printouts	1.75	\$100	\$175.00	52
8/20/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed two binders of Gates Offerings for provisions relevant to matters at issue in plaintiffs' allegations searched for documents produced by DWT relating to the Kraus litigation.	1.75	\$450	\$787.50	51

8/20/2009	Dan Sigelman	Completed review of Offering Memoranda contained in the second of two binders that were drafted and issued from 2005 on for provisions added or changed relating to the matters at issue in plaintiffs' allegations.	2.50	\$450	\$1,125.00	51
8/20/2009	Dan Sigelman	Researched for documents produced by DWT relating to the Kraus litigation; to representative plaintiffs' deals; to intercompany loans; and to attorney R. Gibson Masters and to Timothy Dozois' attendance at Sunwest board meetings.	4.00	\$450	\$1,800.00	51
8/20/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Assembling binder of CMST client's offering materials, pulling docs from database	1.50	\$100	\$150.00	68
8/21/2009	Dan Sigelman	Amended and Restated Promissory Note as of December 5, 2006, between several LLC borrowers and Merrill Lynch Capital.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
8/21/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed the due diligence report of Canyon Creek Development, Inc. by Mick & Associates, PC.	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	51
8/21/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed loan agreement between Merrill Lynch Capital and several LLC borrowers dated June 23, 2006, with particular attention on loan covenants.	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	51
8/21/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed pleadings related to litigation brought by GE Business Financial Services against Harder, Fisher and Sunwest as well as against several LLC borrowers (including Complaint for Breach of Guaranty Agreements and Amended Complaint for Appointment	1.75	\$450	\$787.50	51
8/21/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed documents relating to loan defaults, including notice of default and of acceleration and demand for payment, forbearance agreement and release.	3.25	\$450	\$1,462.50	51
8/21/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Locating case docs, pldgs, loan docs for atty	1.50	\$100	\$150.00	51
8/21/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Compiling billing records from defns that relate to the Kraus litigation, board meetings	1.75	\$100	\$175.00	54
8/24/2009	Anna Ryon	Email Tyler Gaffney re: case status	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
8/24/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted summary notes of the due diligence report of Canyon Creek Development, Inc. by Mick & Associates, PC.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
8/24/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed Oregon law directed to the registration of securities.	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	51
8/24/2009	Dan Sigelman	Began entering a chronology of DWT's/Dozois' knowledge of the Kraus litigation (based on review of billing records) into CaseMap.	3.00	\$450	\$1,350.00	51
8/25/2009	Dan Sigelman	Entered excerpts from DWT's production evidencing DWT's/Dozois' knowledge of the Kraus litigation (based on review of billing records) into CaseMap:	2.25	\$450	\$1,012.50	51
8/26/2009	Anna Ryon	Review receiver's plan of distribution	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	51
8/26/2009	Dan Sigelman	Entered excerpts from DWT's production evidencing DWT's/Dozois' knowledge of the Kraus litigation (based on review of billing records) into CaseMap.	6.50	\$450	\$2,925.00	51
8/26/2009	Tyler Gaffney	updating docket monitoring chart	0.25	\$100	\$25.00	52
8/27/2009	Dan Sigelman	Entered documents from DWT production into CaseMap encompassing numerous topic areas, including these related to multi-facility refinancing and interactions with Gates attorney R. Gibson Masters.	7.75	\$450	\$3,487.50	51
8/27/2009	Tyler Gaffney	organizing DWT billing records based on issues - Kraus litigation, Gibson, board meetings, etc.	1.00	\$100	\$100.00	54
8/28/2009	Dan Sigelman	Searched for additional references to K&L Gates in the document production included in Concordance.	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	51
8/28/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed documents from the docket of GE Business Financial Services, Inc. v. Harder, et al.	1.75	\$450	\$787.50	51

8/28/2009	Dan Sigelman	Entered documents from DWT production into CaseMap encompassing the numerous topic areas, including documents concerning Gates attorney R. Gibson Masters; Timothy Dozois' attendance at Sunwest Board Meetings; DWT awareness of inter-company transfers.	5.25	\$450	\$2,362.50	52
8/31/2009	Dan Sigelman	Entered documents from DWT production into CaseMap encompassing numerous topic areas, including documents relating to the termination of DWT's representation of Canyon Creek Development, Inc. and Sunwest; DWT's working arrangements with Sunwest and Canyon	8.00	\$450	\$3,600.00	52
9/1/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed documents produced by DWT stored in Concordance.	3.50	\$450	\$1,575.00	52
9/1/2009	Dan Sigelman	Entered documents from DWT production into CaseMap encompassing numerous topic areas, including documents relating to loan covenants; K&L Gates contributions to Offering Memoranda; Unregistered securities; and Offering Memoranda provided to representative	4.75	\$450	\$2,137.50	52
9/2/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed memorandum of Biesiadecki interview.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
9/2/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed documents produced by DWT stored in Concordance.	5.00	\$450	\$2,250.00	52
9/2/2009	Dan Sigelman	Began legal research on whether clients could be required to assign their third party claims to the Receiver.	2.25	\$450	\$1,012.50	52
9/2/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Receivership submissions re distribution plan and review case law re same.	7.50	\$450	\$3,375.00	51
9/3/2009	Dan Sigelman	Legal research on the powers of a Receiver to require assignment of investors' potential claims against third parties.	7.50	\$450	\$3,375.00	52
9/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Receivership submissions re distribution plan and review case law re same.	6.50	\$450	\$2,925.00	51
9/4/2009	Dan Sigelman	Legal research on the powers of a Receiver to require assignment of investors' potential claims against third parties.	3.00	\$450	\$1,350.00	52
9/4/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted and emailed to Kit Pierson a memorandum entitled, "The Purported Assignment to the Receiver of Third Party Claims in the Receiver's Distribution Plan."	4.00	\$450	\$1,800.00	52
9/4/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Receivership submissions re distribution plan and review case law re same.	5.50	\$450	\$2,475.00	51
9/5/2009	Dan Sigelman	Email to Kit Pierson re: argument prospective that the Receiver lacks authority to require assignment of third-party claims	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	52
9/6/2009	Dan Sigelman	Email to Kit Pierson addressing the issue that the Receiver lacked the requisite legal consideration in the first instance to obtain assignments from investors of their claims against third parties.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	52
9/8/2009	Dan Sigelman	Searched for pleadings re: the motion to recuse the Honorable Michael R. Hogan and Dissolve the Order Issued March 2, 2009.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
9/8/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed documents produced by DWT stored in Concordance.	7.25	\$450	\$3,262.50	51
9/8/2009	Kit Pierson	Review receivership documents.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
9/8/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with H. Adelman re receivership objections.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
9/8/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation of objections re receivership distribution plan and research law regarding same.	6.50	\$450	\$2,925.00	51
9/8/2009	Steven Toll	Review Kit email regarding status and meeting in Oregon regarding settlement.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	58
9/8/2009	Steven Toll	Review various motions and memos to intervene	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51

9/9/2009	Dan Sigelman	Telephone conference with Justine Fischer re: service and filing of Objections by Putative Class Representatives in D. Kurtz's Canyon Crest, LLC, et al. v. Davis Wright Tremaine et al., to Distribution Plan of Receiver and Chief Restructuring Officer for	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
9/9/2009	Dan Sigelman	Telephone conference with Justine Fischer re: consideration of an additional argument to be included in Objections by Putative Class Representatives in D. Kurtz's Canyon Crest, LLC, et al. v. Davis Wright Tremaine et al., to Distribution Plan of Receiver	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
9/9/2009	Dan Sigelman	Email to Greg Yates, counsel for the CRO, seeking his consent to intervention by three of the class representatives in connection with their filing objections to the Distribution Plan of Receiver and Chief Restructuring Officer for Sunwest Enterprise.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
9/9/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed and edited Objections by Putative Class Representatives in D. Kurtz's Canyon Crest, LLC, et al. v. Davis Wright Tremaine et al., to Distribution Plan of Receiver and Chief Restructuring Officer for Sunwest Enterprise.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
9/9/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted motion to intervene on behalf of three of ten named plaintiffs and putative class representatives, declaration of Kit Pierson in connection with the motion to intervene, and memorandum in support of motion to intervene.	5.50	\$450	\$2,475.00	51
9/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with D. Sigelman re receivership distribution plan.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
9/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re same.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
9/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with P. Trinchero re objections.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
9/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Correspondence to various counsel re consent to intervention. telephone conference with Fickes (SEC) re same.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
9/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation of objections re receivership distribution plan.	6.80	\$450	\$3,060.00	51
9/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Fickes (SEC) re same.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	51
9/9/2009	Steven Toll	Review opposition to intervention and distribution plan filed by Grenley etc.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
9/10/2009	Anna Ryon	Review new filings in case	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52
9/10/2009	Dan Sigelman	Revised and edited entries made in CaseMap.	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	51
9/10/2009	Dan Sigelman	Meeting with Kit Pierson and conference call with Justine Fischer re: feasibility and need to review client documents in the possession of Gary Grenley as per the Receiver's request.	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	51
9/10/2009	Dan Sigelman	Entered more documents into CaseMap, e.g., documents regarding the Kraus litigation.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
9/10/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed documents produced by DWT stored in Concordance.	4.25	\$450	\$1,912.50	51
9/10/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re document review.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
9/10/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with D. Sigelman re document review, organizing info re DWT.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
9/10/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conf. with G. Grenley re document review.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
9/10/2009	Kit Pierson	Review factual materials from D. Sigelman re DWT.	2.40	\$450	\$1,080.00	51
9/10/2009	Steven Toll	Review objections to distribution plan and discuss.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
9/11/2009	Dan Sigelman	Meeting with Kit Pierson to discuss the work that had been done in response to his memorandum of August 16, 2009.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
9/11/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed August 10, 2009, letter, including attachments, from Stephen Walters to the Honorable Lyle C. Velure re: entitlement to review a file removed from DWT's production to the Receiver.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51

9/11/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed documents used in Biesiadecki interview and Biesiadecki materials provided by Cromwell.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
9/11/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed hard copies of documents produced by DWT that were printed from Concordance.	3.75	\$450	\$1,687.50	51
9/11/2009	Dan Sigelman	Entered documents from review of DWT production and Stephen Walters' August 10, 2009, letter to the Honorable Lyle C. Velure into CaseMap.	2.25	\$450	\$1,012.50	51
9/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re 9/11 interview.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
9/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with D. Sigelman re analysis of DWT liability issues/facts and preparation for mediation, review records re same.	1.30	\$450	\$585.00	51
9/14/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted summary and narrative of facts relating to DWT's liability based on documents produced by DWT and other related documents.	7.25	\$450	\$3,262.50	51
9/14/2009	Kit Pierson	Review factual materials compiled by D. Sigelman.	1.20	\$450	\$540.00	51
9/15/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conf. with J. Fischer re deposition schedule, discovery, receivership plan proceeding.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
9/15/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conf. with D. Dean and G. Grenley re review of Grenley/Connolly documents re DWT.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
9/15/2009	Kit Pierson	Review factual materials re harder/DWT compiled by D. Sigelman for mediation and meeting with D. Sigelman re same.	2.40	\$450	\$1,080.00	51
9/16/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted summary and narrative of facts relating to DWT's liability based on documents produced by DWT and other related documents.	3.75	\$450	\$1,687.50	51
9/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re discovery, preparation for mediation, and telephone conference with J. Fischer re implications of sale on third party claims.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
9/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with G. Grenley, D. Dean, and Paul Connolly's office re documents from DWT.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
9/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Review documents from DWT.	4.00	\$450	\$1,800.00	51
9/17/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted summary and narrative of facts relating to DWT's liability based on documents produced by DWT and other related documents.	7.25	\$450	\$3,262.50	51
9/17/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with H. Milstein re receivership/assignment issue.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
9/17/2009	Kit Pierson	Review factual materials from D. Sigelman.	1.40	\$450	\$630.00	51
9/17/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Pulling briefs and making copies for atty on case	0.75	\$100	\$75.00	51
9/18/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted summary and narrative of facts relating to DWT's liability based on documents produced by DWT and other related documents.	6.25	\$450	\$2,812.50	51
9/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conf. with J. Fischer re mediation strategy.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
9/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with D. Sigelman re document review.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
9/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with G. Grenley re mediation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
9/18/2009	Kit Pierson	Review factual compilation/materials from D. Sigelman.	2.60	\$450	\$1,170.00	51
9/18/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit Pierson re strategies, issues, upcoming hearing and mediation	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	58
9/18/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Pulling briefs for attys	0.50	\$100	\$50.00	68
9/19/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted summary and narrative of facts relating to DWT's liability based on documents produced by DWT and other related documents.	2.25	\$450	\$1,012.50	51
9/20/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted summary and narrative of facts relating to DWT's liability based on documents produced by DWT and other related documents.	8.75	\$450	\$3,937.50	51

9/21/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted summary and narrative of facts relating to DWT's liability based on documents produced by DWT and other related documents.	5.50	\$450	\$2,475.00	51
9/21/2009	Dan Sigelman	Inspected Sunwest client documents in the office of Grenley, Rotenberg, Evans, Bragg & Bodie, PC for communications received from DWT lawyers.	6.00	\$450	\$2,700.00	51
9/21/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with David Dean re Receivership response re third party claims.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
9/21/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re same and mediation/discovery issues/hearing in Eugene.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
9/21/2009	Kit Pierson	Review corresp. re Receivership issues/hearing.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
9/21/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Oregon securities cases.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
9/21/2009	Kit Pierson	Draft letter to Receiver re Wielde documents and other matters.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
9/21/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Wielde documents.	2.20	\$450	\$990.00	51
9/21/2009	Steven Toll	Review reply filings by SEC re receivership Plan and discuss.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
9/21/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Compiling docs for co-counsel	1.25	\$100	\$125.00	68
9/22/2009	Dan Sigelman	Inspected Sunwest client documents in the office of Grenley, Rotenberg, Evans, Bragg & Bodie, P.C. for communications received from DWT lawyers.	3.50	\$450	\$1,575.00	51
9/22/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted summary and narrative of facts relating to DWT's liability based on documents produced by DWT and other related documents.	7.25	\$450	\$3,262.50	51
9/22/2009	Kit Pierson	Travel to Oregon for Receivership plan hearing.	3.00	\$450	\$1,350.00	51
9/23/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with J. Fischer re strategy for mediation/receivership issues.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
9/23/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Kevin Jacoby, David Dean et al re same.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
9/23/2009	Kit Pierson	Attending receivership hearing.	5.00	\$450	\$2,250.00	51
9/24/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with J. Fischer et al re same and going forward plan re mediation/receivership/state class action litigation.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
9/24/2009	Kit Pierson	Attending mediation re DWT litigation.	3.50	\$450	\$1,575.00	51
9/25/2009	Dan Sigelman	Engaged in targeted searches for documents produced by DWT in Concordance to add to CaseMap chronology.	1.75	\$450	\$787.50	51
9/25/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed additional documents, including documents obtained from the offices of Gary Grenley, related to DWT's activities.	3.75	\$450	\$1,687.50	51
9/25/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Tracking down and copying production docs and sending to Grenley firm	2.50	\$100	\$250.00	60
9/28/2009	Kit Pierson	Travel to Portland, Oregon.	3.00	\$450	\$1,350.00	68
9/28/2009	Kit Pierson	Review factual materials for mediation, DWT documents, prior interviews, Harder deposition; related complaints against DWT & other law firms.	5.40	\$450	\$2,430.00	51
9/28/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Copying cds and locating docs to send to co-counsel, Steve Walters	2.00	\$100	\$200.00	60
9/29/2009	Dan Sigelman	Entered documents, including documents obtained from the offices of Gary Grenley, related to DWT's activities, into CaseMap chronology.	3.50	\$450	\$1,575.00	51
9/29/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Grenley re resolving issues for mediation.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
9/29/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with K. Jacobs (Connolly law firm) re information needed for mediation.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
9/29/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Sigelman re info requested by Receiver.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
9/29/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with H. Adelman regarding info for mediation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
9/29/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with J. Fischer re mediation issues, fees, etc.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
9/29/2009	Kit Pierson	Review DWT factual materials/prior interview.	3.60	\$450	\$1,620.00	51

9/29/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with S. Walters re mediation issues.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	51
9/30/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed memorandum of September 25, 2009, interview of Shane Pearse by David Dean.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
9/30/2009	Dan Sigelman	Entered documents related to DWT's activities into CaseMap chronology.	6.50	\$450	\$2,925.00	51
9/30/2009	Kit Pierson	Review cases re contribution in connection with mediation.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
9/30/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Justine Fischer re mediation strategy and related class issues.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
9/30/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Receiver, Mike Esler, John Stephens, etc. re mediation strategy.	0.70	\$450	\$315.00	51
9/30/2009	Kit Pierson	Attending interview of James Estes.	4.00	\$450	\$1,800.00	51
10/1/2009	Dan Sigelman	Entered documents, including those provided by representative plaintiffs and Richard Wiede, into CaseMap chronology.	7.50	\$450	\$3,375.00	51
10/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with G. Grenley regarding mediation issues.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
10/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Review documents from DWT for mediation.	2.90	\$450	\$1,305.00	51
10/1/2009	Kit Pierson	Attending Wettlaufer interview; preparing summary of interview.	3.50	\$450	\$1,575.00	51
10/1/2009	Steven Toll	Review emails regarding filings; discussion with Kit regarding staffing and strategies.	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	51
10/1/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Updating docket tracking chart	0.25	\$100	\$25.00	52
10/2/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed Kit Pierson's memorandum of mediation interview with Thomas J. Wettlaufer.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
10/2/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed the Court's order approving the Receiver's Distribution Plan as well as the revised plan.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
10/2/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted a notice of correspondence and correspondence to Judge Hogan requesting an opportunity to be heard before the Court rules on plaintiffs' objections to the assignment to the Receiver of third-party claims in the Receiver's proposed Distribution Pla	1.75	\$450	\$787.50	51
10/2/2009	Dan Sigelman	Entered documents into CaseMap chronology.	4.75	\$450	\$2,137.50	51
10/2/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Dean re mediation/settlement.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
10/2/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re mediation/settlements.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
10/2/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with G. Grenley re status of mediation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
10/2/2009	Kit Pierson	Attending Thurber interview and drafting up notes from interviews for mediation.	7.00	\$450	\$3,150.00	51
10/2/2009	Steven Toll	Update with Kit Pierson; strategize regarding mediation	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	58
10/2/2009	Tyler Gaffney	completing update of docket tracking	0.50	\$100	\$50.00	52
10/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Review notes and documents from other interviews.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
10/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Review draft mediation statement.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
10/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Sigelman summary and supporting materials.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
10/3/2009	Kit Pierson	Review DWT documents from Receiver.	4.00	\$450	\$1,800.00	51
10/4/2009	Kit Pierson	Review/edit written submission to mediator.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
10/4/2009	Kit Pierson	Review documents from Receiver re DWT.	4.50	\$450	\$2,025.00	51
10/5/2009	Dan Sigelman	Spoke with Kit Pierson re: mediation and related documents.	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
10/5/2009	Dan Sigelman	Located and had faxed to Kit Pierson numerous documents he requested in preparation for the mediation.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
10/5/2009	Dan Sigelman	Spoke with Karen Handorf, Emmy Levens, and Peter Roman-Friedman re: prospects for moving to stay and appealing from the Court's approval of the Distribution Plan to the Ninth Circuit.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
10/5/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed the Distribution Plan approved by the Court.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51



10/5/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed the Coordinated Lenders' Emergency Motion for Stay Pending Appeal of Distribution of Distribution Order.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	51
10/5/2009	Dan Sigelman	Began assembling notes and excerpts to use in an appellate brief re: receivership/assignment issues.	4.00	\$450	\$1,800.00	51
10/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with G. Grenley et al re mediation strategy.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
10/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Esler draft Executive Summary.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
10/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Review SEC Industry Guide 5 & Reg D; TIC Best Practices Memo.	0.70	\$450	\$315.00	51
10/5/2009	Kit Pierson	Review DWT documents.	4.20	\$450	\$1,890.00	51
10/5/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Pulling statutes from amended complaint and sending to K. Pierson	1.00	\$100	\$100.00	52
10/6/2009	Amos Presler	Answered D. Sigelman's questions about my prior memo on enjoining investors' state claims. Reviewed new Sunwest materials including receiver's distribution plan and judge's order.	1.50	\$200	\$300.00	52
10/6/2009	Anna Ryon	Research anti-injunction act	4.75	\$275	\$1,306.25	52
10/6/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed applicable Federal Rules of Appellate Procedure for the Ninth Circuit.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
10/6/2009	Dan Sigelman	Conference call with Kit Pierson, David Dean, and Justine Fischer re: first day of mediation.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
10/6/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed Kit Pierson's memoranda of the mediation interviews of James Estes and Dave Thurber.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
10/6/2009	Dan Sigelman	Extensive legal research on the Anti-Injunction Act and the All Writs Act for possible use in an appeal and discussions with Amos Pressler and Anna Ryon re same.	6.00	\$450	\$2,700.00	51
10/6/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Grenley et al re mediation status/strategy.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
10/6/2009	Kit Pierson	Review cases/materials re appeal of distribution plan/assignment order.	2.20	\$450	\$990.00	51
10/6/2009	Kit Pierson	Attending mediation re DWT claims.	5.50	\$450	\$2,475.00	51
10/7/2009	Anna Ryon	Review distribution order	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	52
10/7/2009	Anna Ryon	Research appeals process	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52
10/7/2009	Anna Ryon	Review briefs on emergency motion to stay	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52
10/7/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed Opposition to Appellants' Emergency Motion for Stay Pending Appeal of Distribution Order.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
10/7/2009	Dan Sigelman	Conference call with Kit Pierson and David Dean re: second day of mediation.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
10/7/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted appellate brief sections on violation of the Anti-Injunction Act.	7.00	\$450	\$3,150.00	51
10/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Fischer re status of mediation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
10/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Grenley re same.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
10/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Review cases/materials re appeal of distribution plan/assignment order.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
10/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Attending mediation re DWT claims.	5.70	\$450	\$2,565.00	51
10/8/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted appellate brief sections on violation of the Anti-Injunction Act.	7.50	\$450	\$3,375.00	51
10/8/2009	Kit Pierson	Travel from mediation to D.C.	4.50	\$450	\$2,025.00	51
10/8/2009	Steven Toll	Emails with Kit Pierson regarding mediation related issues.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	58
10/9/2009	Anna Ryon	Research appeals process	2.75	\$275	\$756.25	57
10/9/2009	Dan Sigelman	Westlaw research and email to Kit Pierson on the question of whether allowing Claimants to proceed with their third party state court claims if they obtain prior court approval would not run afoul of the Anti-Injunction Act.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
10/9/2009	Dan Sigelman	Reviewed additional case law for appellate brief on Anti-Injunction Act issues.	2.25	\$450	\$1,012.50	51
10/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Esler & Walters re mediation strategy.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51

10/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Sunwest clients to discuss mediation.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
10/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Review and edit draft re same and meeting w/Steve Toll re mediation issues/strategy.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
10/9/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D Sigelman re motion to modify distribution plan/assignment provision.	4.40	\$450	\$1,980.00	51
10/9/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit Pierson and email exchange versus mediation and strategy	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	58
10/10/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted appellate brief sections on violation of the Anti-Injunction Act.	10.75	\$450	\$4,837.50	51
10/11/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted appellate brief sections on violations of the Anti-Injunction Act.	8.25	\$450	\$3,712.50	51
10/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Travel to Oregon for mediation.	5.00	\$450	\$2,250.00	51
10/12/2009	Dan Sigelman	Drafted appellate brief sections on violation of the Anti-Injunction Act.	2.50	\$450	\$1,125.00	51
10/13/2009	Anna Ryon	Research if distribution order is an injunction	0.50	\$275	\$137.50	52
10/13/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Grenley et al regarding mediation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
10/13/2009	Kit Pierson	Attending DWT mediation and review materials/cases regarding potential appeal during mediation.	7.80	\$450	\$3,510.00	51
10/14/2009	Anna Ryon	Research appellate procedure	0.25	\$275	\$68.75	57
10/14/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Grenley et al re mediation.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
10/14/2009	Kit Pierson	Attending DWT mediation; review materials/cases re potential appeal during mediation.	7.80	\$450	\$3,510.00	51
10/14/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit Pierson re mediation and strategy	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	58
10/15/2009	Anna Ryon	Research whether distribution order is an injunction	1.75	\$275	\$481.25	52
10/15/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with S. Toll re terms of possible settlement.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
10/15/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with client re settlement discussions and proposed terms.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
10/15/2009	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Grenley et al re mediation.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	51
10/15/2009	Kit Pierson	Attending mediation.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	51
10/15/2009	Steven Toll	Further discussion with Kit Pierson re mediation and strategy	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	58
10/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Travel to DC from mediation.	4.50	\$450	\$2,025.00	51
10/19/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with client, J. Fischer regarding same.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
10/19/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Copying and storing SEC investigation disk	0.25	\$100	\$25.00	68
10/21/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Arellano re status conference before Oregon court.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
10/21/2009	Tyler Gaffney	Pulling case docs to send to client	1.00	\$100	\$100.00	63
11/6/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Arellano regarding settlement terms.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
11/6/2009	Kit Pierson	Legal research regarding possible settlement structures, notice/opt out requirements, non-opt out class.	1.40	\$450	\$630.00	59
11/11/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re settlement issues; telephone conference with Esler & Walters re same; telephone conference with S. Toll re same.	0.80	\$450	\$360.00	59
11/11/2009	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit regarding settlement issues	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	58
11/12/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re settlement issues.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	60
11/12/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Arellano, D. Keppler et al re settlement issues.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	60
11/12/2009	Steven Toll	Call with Kit Pierson and PWC Counsel regarding settlement issues.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	58
11/23/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Herb Adelman regarding settlement, fees, etc.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
11/23/2009	Kit Pierson	Review Ninth Circuit materials regarding fees	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
11/25/2009	Kit Pierson	Review attorney fee case law.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
11/30/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Keppler regarding settlement structure/class action.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
12/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Review settlement/fee petition materials.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	59

12/7/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Keppler regarding settlement terms and structure.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	59
12/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Keppler regarding settlement class issues.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	59
12/16/2009	Kit Pierson	Drafting federal complaint for settlement purposes.	2.20	\$450	\$990.00	59
12/17/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation of Federal complaint.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	59
12/17/2009	Kit Pierson	Preparation of attorney fee petition materials.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	59
12/21/2009	Kit Pierson	Prepare complaint for federal court for settlement purposes and review CAFA re jurisdictional issues.	2.20	\$450	\$990.00	51
12/23/2009	Kit Pierson	Telephone conferences with Mr. Esler; J. Fischer; D. Keppler re settlement papers/structure of settlement.	0.80	\$450	\$360.00	59
12/30/2009	Steven Toll	Review Davis Wright clarification motion and papers and Kit's emails re issues.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	58
12/31/2009	Steven Toll	Issues re DWT Motion for clarification; factual analysis	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	58
1/5/2010	Steven Toll	Review TIC Comm filing re DWT clarification motion	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	51
1/20/2010	Steven Toll	Meet with Kit Pierson to strategize regarding DWT settlement issues	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	58
1/25/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Mr. Keppler regarding settlement	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
1/25/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Esler & Stephens regarding settlement	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
1/25/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer regarding settlement	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	58
1/25/2010	Kit Pierson	Draft counter-proposal based on discussions with Mike Esler and J. Fischer	3.00	\$450	\$1,350.00	51
2/1/2010	Kit Pierson	Review draft settlement document; telephone conference with Esler regarding settlement.	0.60	\$450	\$270.00	59
2/8/2010	Kit Pierson	Review revisions to draft settlement agreement.	0.80	\$450	\$360.00	59
2/11/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Messrs. Esler, Connolly, et al. regarding settlement.	0.60	\$450	\$270.00	59
2/11/2010	Kit Pierson	Revise draft settlement based on discussion with other counsel	0.80	\$450	\$360.00	58
2/15/2010	Kit Pierson	Draft revised language for settlement per discussion with J. Stewart et al.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	58
2/15/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Mike Esler regarding settlement.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
2/15/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with John Stewart, Steve Walters and M. Esler regarding DWT proposed settlement.	0.70	\$450	\$315.00	58
2/18/2010	Kit Pierson	Draft edits per telephone conversation with S. Walters.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	58
2/18/2010	Kit Pierson	Review revised settlement agreement from Steve Walters.	2.10	\$450	\$945.00	51
2/18/2010	Kit Pierson	Conference call with Steve Walters, John Stewart, Mike Esler regarding settlement.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	58
2/18/2010	Steven Toll	Issue regarding opt out and blow provision with DWT	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	58
2/19/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Mr. Esler and Ms. Fisher regarding holdback.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
2/19/2010	Kit Pierson	Review drafts and prepare draft per John Stewart's request.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	59
3/5/2010	Steven Toll	Meeting with Mike Esler regarding case and settlement issues.	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	58
3/16/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with S. Walters regarding status of settlement.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
3/17/2010	Joshua Devore	Draft withdrawal of D. Sigelman appearance	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	51
3/21/2010	Kit Pierson	Review settlement agreement and telephone conferences to M. Esler and J.Fischer regarding same.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	59
3/22/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conferences with M. Esler, D. Dean, J. Fischer, S. Walters regarding proposed settlement and draft proposed changes for J. Stewart.	1.80	\$450	\$810.00	59
3/22/2010	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit regarding O/S issues in settlement agreement and review emails regarding issues	0.75	\$450	\$337.50	58
3/24/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with S. Walters regarding settlement.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	51
3/24/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Dean regarding settlement	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	58

3/24/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer regarding settlement	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	58
3/24/2010	Kit Pierson	Draft proposed language to send to Esler regarding settlement	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	58
3/24/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with M. Esler regarding same	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	58
3/24/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Messrs. Esler, Connolly, Dean and Fischer regarding settlement	0.70	\$450	\$315.00	58
3/25/2010	Kit Pierson	Review draft settlement agreement.	1.60	\$450	\$720.00	59
3/25/2010	Steven Toll	Review settlement agreement and O/S issues	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	58
3/26/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with S. Walters regarding same.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
3/26/2010	Kit Pierson	Correspondence to other plaintiffs' counsel regarding same.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
3/26/2010	Kit Pierson	Review draft settlement papers.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	59
3/26/2010	Steven Toll	Further review of settlement papers and o/s disputed issues.	1.25	\$450	\$562.50	58
3/30/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference regarding settlement with Dan Keppler.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
3/30/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conferences regarding settlement with Justice Fischer	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
3/30/2010	Kit Pierson	Responding to correspondence from Dean, Walters, Keppler regarding settlement, draft language regarding same.	0.60	\$450	\$270.00	51
4/1/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conferences with Dan Keppler; Steve Walters; David Dean; Paul Connolly re settlement issues posed by Section 9.2; agreement re dismissal with prejudice; terms of supplemental agreement with DWT.	1.20	\$450	\$540.00	51
4/2/2010	Kit Pierson	Communications with Keppler, Walters re settlement.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
4/5/2010	Joshua Devore	Corresp. w/ Kit Pierson re: Sigelman withdrawal	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
4/5/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Keppler regarding settlement issues.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
4/8/2010	Daniel Sommers	With K. Pierson re: settlement	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
4/8/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Mr. Grenley re settlement	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
4/8/2010	Kit Pierson	Review settlement papers.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	59
4/8/2010	Kit Pierson	Review and respond to correspondence re settlement issues.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	59
4/9/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Meet with Kit to discuss status of case/projects	0.75	\$300	\$225.00	60
4/9/2010	Kit Pierson	Review materials for settlement preliminary approval papers, notice, etc.	0.80	\$450	\$360.00	59
4/12/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Research filing of class settlement	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
4/12/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Background reading	1.00	\$300	\$300.00	51
4/12/2010	Kit Pierson	Review and respond to email re settlement terms.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
4/12/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer, D. Kurtz re settlement.	1.20	\$450	\$540.00	59
4/13/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Research filing of class settlement	2.25	\$300	\$675.00	51
4/13/2010	Kit Pierson	Review materials for fee petition in connection with settlement.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	59
4/14/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Research filing of class settlement	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
4/14/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Discuss case with Kit Pierson and read emails	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	60
4/14/2010	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Dan Sommers re procedural requirements for coordinating class and receivership cases for settlement, notice, etc.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
4/14/2010	Kit Pierson	Meeting with J. Kolsky re pleadings to be prepared, and procedural issue, to effectuate class action settlement.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
4/14/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Dean regarding relationship between litigation trust and other distributions in connection with settlement.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
4/14/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Keppler re settlement issues.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
4/14/2010	Kit Pierson	Review legal requirements under CAFA, PSLRA re class action settlement.	0.60	\$450	\$270.00	59

4/14/2010	Kit Pierson	Preparation for conference call with clients regarding settlement and conference call with Grenley, Dean, and Plaintiffs.	1.20	\$450	\$540.00	59
4/14/2010	Kit Pierson	Review materials for fee petition in connection with settlement.	2.60	\$450	\$1,170.00	59
4/15/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare proposed schedule for class settlement	3.00	\$300	\$900.00	51
4/15/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Review background materials re: litigation	4.50	\$300	\$1,350.00	51
4/15/2010	Kit Pierson	Meeting with J. Kolsky re pleadings that need to be prepared to effectuate class action settlement.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
4/15/2010	Kit Pierson	Review client LLC agreements for purposes of drafting documents executing settlement and prepare letters to clients.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	59
4/15/2010	Tyler Gaffney	Pulling offering memoranda for clients	1.50	\$100	\$150.00	54
4/16/2010	Daniel Sommers	Review settlement schedule; with K. Pierce and J. Kolsky	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	58
4/16/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Call with Receiver's counsel regarding settlement procedures	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	60
4/16/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare proposed schedule for class settlement	1.75	\$300	\$525.00	51
4/16/2010	Kit Pierson	Meeting with D. Sommers re settlement	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
4/16/2010	Kit Pierson	Meeting with J. Kolsky and telephone conference with S. Walters re projects for filing class settlement.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	59
4/19/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare motion for preliminary approval	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
4/19/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Esler re effectuating class certification settlement.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
4/20/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare motion for preliminary approval	4.25	\$300	\$1,275.00	51
4/21/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare motion for preliminary approval	5.25	\$300	\$1,575.00	51
4/21/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re settlement.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
4/21/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Keppler regarding settlement.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
4/21/2010	Kit Pierson	Revising amended complaint.	0.80	\$450	\$360.00	59
4/22/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Review Defendants' reply briefs	1.00	\$300	\$300.00	51
4/22/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare motion for preliminary approval	3.75	\$300	\$1,125.00	51
4/22/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with L. Hiebert re settlement.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
4/22/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re same.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
4/22/2010	Kit Pierson	Preparation of complaint for federal settlement.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	59
4/23/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Review Defendants' reply briefs and meet to discuss	1.75	\$300	\$525.00	51
4/23/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare motion for preliminary approval	5.00	\$300	\$1,500.00	51
4/24/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with plaintiff re settlement.	0.60	\$450	\$270.00	59
4/26/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Call with co-counsel regarding response to evidentiary objections	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	54
4/26/2010	Kit Pierson	Preparation of side letter re settlement; correspondence re same.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
4/26/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Dean re federal complaint.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
4/26/2010	Kit Pierson	Preparation of federal complaint.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	59
4/26/2010	Kit Pierson	Review of settlement papers from J. Kolsky re same.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	59
4/27/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Keppler re settlement.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
4/27/2010	Kit Pierson	Preparation of federal complaint.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
4/29/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Review Receiver's documents	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
4/29/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Call with David Dean re federal complaint	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
4/29/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Conference call with Receiver's counsel	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	60
4/29/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Dean re federal complaint and related issues.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59

4/29/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Steve Walters and review materials re settlement from same.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	59
5/6/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Review documents re class notice	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
5/6/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise federal complaint	3.75	\$300	\$1,125.00	51
5/7/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise motion for preliminary approval and proposed orders; discuss with Kit Pierson	2.00	\$300	\$600.00	51
5/8/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Mr. Grenley re same.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
5/8/2010	Kit Pierson	Review settlement papers.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	59
5/8/2010	Kit Pierson	Review and respond to correspondence re settlement issues.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	59
5/9/2010	Kit Pierson	Review materials for settlement preliminary approval, notice, etc.	0.80	\$450	\$360.00	59
5/10/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Conference call with Receiver's counsel to discuss class notice	0.75	\$300	\$225.00	51
5/10/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Draft class notice	3.25	\$300	\$975.00	51
5/10/2010	Kit Pierson	Drafting Federal complaint.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	51
5/10/2010	Kit Pierson	Meeting with J. Kolsky re settlement papers and telephone conference with J. Kolsky and S. Walters re same.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	51
5/11/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Meeting with K. Pierson to discuss class notice	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
5/11/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Research jurisdiction re: class case	1.00	\$300	\$300.00	51
5/11/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Draft class notice	5.00	\$300	\$1,500.00	51
5/11/2010	Kit Pierson	Correspondence with M. Esler, J. Fisher, D. Dean, etc. re various issues related to new complaint, settlement.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	59
5/11/2010	Kit Pierson	Revising federal complaint.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	59
5/11/2010	Kit Pierson	Meeting with Josh Kolsky et al regarding issues presented by settlement; drafting papers regarding same.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	59
5/11/2010	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit Pierson, Josh Kolsky, and D. Sommers re settlement documents; claim form and notice	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	58
5/12/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Begin drafting claims form	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
5/12/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Draft motion for preliminary approval	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
5/12/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Draft summary notice	0.75	\$300	\$225.00	51
5/12/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise memo in support of motion for preliminary approval	1.75	\$300	\$525.00	51
5/12/2010	Kit Pierson	Review and respond to email re settlement terms.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
5/12/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone call with J. Fischer and clients re settlement.	1.20	\$450	\$540.00	59
5/13/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise preliminary approval documents	2.00	\$300	\$600.00	51
5/17/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Draft claim form	1.75	\$300	\$525.00	51
5/21/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Call counsel to get information on new class rep	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
5/21/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise preliminary approval documents	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
5/24/2010	Kit Pierson	Review/edit drafts of court filings implementing settlement agreement.	1.60	\$450	\$720.00	59
5/25/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise preliminary approval documents	1.50	\$300	\$450.00	51
5/25/2010	Kit Pierson	Review/edit drafts of court filings implementing settlement agreement.	1.80	\$450	\$810.00	59
5/26/2010	Kit Pierson	Reviewing/editing drafts of pleadings for filing in connection with settlement.	2.20	\$450	\$990.00	59
5/27/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise preliminary approval documents	2.00	\$300	\$600.00	51
5/28/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise settlement documents	2.75	\$300	\$825.00	51
6/1/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise settlement papers	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
6/1/2010	Kit Pierson	Review and revise Sunwest settlement papers.	1.50	\$450	\$675.00	59
6/3/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare for and participate in conference call re: settlement documents	1.25	\$300	\$375.00	51

6/3/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with S. Walters re settlement documents.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
6/3/2010	Kit Pierson	Review settlement pleadings.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	59
6/4/2010	Daniel Sommers	Meet with K. Pierson and J. Kolsky	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	60
6/4/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Call with DWT counsel re: settlement papers	1.25	\$300	\$375.00	51
6/4/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Research questions regarding notice and class definition	2.25	\$300	\$675.00	51
6/4/2010	Kit Pierson	Review settlement pleadings and telephone conference with Keppler et al re same.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	59
6/8/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise class notice	1.00	\$300	\$300.00	51
6/9/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Read and send emails regarding settlement documents	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	54
6/10/2010	Daniel Sommers	E-mail with K. Pierson re: settlement papers	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
6/10/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Conference call re: settlement documents	0.75	\$300	\$225.00	51
6/10/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise settlement documents	4.25	\$300	\$1,275.00	51
6/10/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Esler et al re settlement issues/class definition.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	59
6/10/2010	Kit Pierson	Revising settlement papers.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	59
6/11/2010	Daniel Sommers	Meet with K. Pierson re: settlement papers and class definition issues	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
6/12/2010	Kit Pierson	Revising settlement papers per discussions with DWT counsel and Mike Esler.	2.40	\$450	\$1,080.00	59
6/13/2010	Kit Pierson	Revising settlement papers per discussions with DWT counsel and Mike Esler.	4.00	\$450	\$1,800.00	59
6/14/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise settlement approval papers	3.25	\$300	\$975.00	51
6/15/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise settlement approval documents	1.50	\$300	\$450.00	51
6/15/2010	Kit Pierson	Review and respond to correspondence from Keppler et al re settlement pleadings.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
6/16/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise settlement approval documents	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
6/16/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Call re: settlement approval documents	1.00	\$300	\$300.00	51
6/16/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Keppler re terms of settlement agreement papers to be submitted to Court.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
6/16/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Kolsky regarding same.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
6/16/2010	Kit Pierson	Review and respond to email correspondence re settlement pleadings and telephone conference with Messrs. Keppler, Kolsky and Esler re same.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	59
6/17/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise settlement approval documents	6.50	\$300	\$1,950.00	51
6/17/2010	Kit Pierson	Reviewing revised settlement papers and providing edits re same to Esler and Kolsky and sending correspondence to Esler and S. Walters re finalizing settlement.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	51
6/17/2010	Kit Pierson	Reviewing revised settlement papers and providing edits re same to Esler and Kolsky and sending correspondence to Esler and S. Walters re finalizing settlement.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	59
6/21/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise settlement approval documents	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
6/21/2010	Kit Pierson	Review and revise settlement pleadings.	1.00	\$450	\$450.00	59
6/22/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Determine remaining settlement approval issues and draft email	1.00	\$300	\$300.00	51
6/24/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Edit and cite-check settlement papers	0.75	\$300	\$225.00	51
6/25/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Read emails and send settlement documents	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
6/28/2010	Daniel Sommers	Meeting with J. Kolsky re: notice to shareholders	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
6/28/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Discuss claim form/notice with defense counsel and Dan Sommers	1.25	\$300	\$375.00	51
6/29/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Call with co-counsel regarding settlement documents	0.75	\$300	\$225.00	51
6/29/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise settlement documents	2.00	\$300	\$600.00	51
6/29/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Steve Walters, Esler, etc. regarding settlement terms.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
6/30/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise Settlement Documents	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
6/30/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Call with defense counsel re: settlement papers	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51

6/30/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Kolsky and D. Keppler re settlement terms for class case.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
7/1/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Call with Kit Pierson re: settlement documents	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
7/2/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise settlement documents	1.25	\$300	\$375.00	51
7/2/2010	Kit Pierson	Meeting with J. Kolsky re settlement revisions.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
7/6/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise settlement documents	1.25	\$300	\$375.00	51
7/6/2010	Kit Pierson	Review and edit revised settlement papers and discuss with J. Kolsky.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	59
7/7/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise settlement documents	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
7/7/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Keppler re schedule/revised papers.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
7/7/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with M. Esler re same.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
7/7/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Kolsky re revisions to settlement papers.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
7/8/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise settlement documents	0.75	\$300	\$225.00	51
7/8/2010	Kit Pierson	Review revised settlement papers and discuss same with Josh Kolsky.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
7/9/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Finalize settlement papers; draft motion for expedited consideration of motion	2.00	\$300	\$600.00	51
7/9/2010	Kit Pierson	Revising settlement pleadings.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	59
7/12/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Download and send settlement documents	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
7/12/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Keppler re possible addition to notice.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
7/13/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Call with defense counsel re: settlement papers	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
7/14/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Send email re: class notice	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	60
7/15/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise pro hac vice motions	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
7/16/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Check docket and review pro hac vices	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
7/19/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with client re federal class action suit.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
7/20/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Kolsky re pleading re revised notice.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
7/21/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Discuss new filing with defense counsel	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
7/22/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Meet with Kit Pierson to discuss supplemental filing	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
7/23/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Draft supplemental motion	1.75	\$300	\$525.00	51
7/26/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Finalize settlement documents for re-filing	1.25	\$300	\$375.00	51
7/26/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Keppler re same.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
7/26/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with H. Adelman re settlement pleadings/issues.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
7/27/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Email Receiver re: claims admin duties	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	53
7/28/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Amend complaint	2.00	\$300	\$600.00	51
8/23/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Review materials re fee application	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
8/23/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Review materials re: fee application	0.75	\$300	\$225.00	51
8/23/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Review Ninth Circuit decision on settlement objection schedules and confirm compliance	0.75	\$300	\$225.00	52
8/25/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Meet with Kit Pierson about fee application	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
8/25/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare fee application	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
8/26/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare fee application	2.50	\$300	\$750.00	51
8/27/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare fee application memo	1.00	\$300	\$300.00	51
8/27/2010	Kit Pierson	Review materials regarding fee petition.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	51
8/30/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Meet with Kit Pierson about fee application	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
8/30/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Research rates and prepare chart of suggested hourly rates for fee application	1.00	\$300	\$300.00	51
8/30/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare fee application memo	4.50	\$300	\$1,350.00	51



8/30/2010	Kit Pierson	Review fee petition materials.	0.60	\$450	\$270.00	51
8/31/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Begin drafting Pierson declaration	1.25	\$300	\$375.00	51
8/31/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare fee application memo	2.75	\$300	\$825.00	51
8/31/2010	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit re settlement and fee issues	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
9/1/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Meet with Kit Pierson re: fee application	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
9/1/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare draft of Pierson declaration	1.50	\$300	\$450.00	51
9/2/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise fee application	2.50	\$300	\$750.00	51
9/2/2010	Kit Pierson	Review Court order re attorney fee application and prepare draft response to email to Esler re same.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	59
9/3/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise fee application and send to Kit Pierson	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
9/28/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Research statutory requirements for setting hearing dates	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	52
9/28/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Mr. Esler regarding coordination of DWT and other settlements.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
10/1/2010	Daniel Sommers	E-mail from and to K. Pierson re: class issues	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
10/1/2010	Tyler Gaffney	Pulling case documents, state and federal for K. Pierson	1.00	\$100	\$100.00	52
10/5/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Gather documents for hearing	1.50	\$300	\$450.00	71
10/5/2010	Kit Pierson	Preparation for October 8 hearing.	0.40	\$450	\$180.00	59
10/6/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Gather materials for hearing	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	71
10/6/2010	Kit Pierson	Review preliminary approval pleadings and notice; telephone conference with Mike Esler regarding same.	0.80	\$450	\$360.00	59
10/7/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re preliminary approval hearing.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
10/7/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with D. Keppler regarding preliminary approval hearing.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
10/7/2010	Kit Pierson	Travel to Oregon for hearing.	2.00	\$450	\$900.00	59
10/7/2010	Kit Pierson	Preparation for preliminary approval hearing, including review of pleadings in DWT litigation and in consolidated against KLG and TN.	2.50	\$450	\$1,125.00	59
10/8/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Gather documents for hearing	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	71
10/8/2010	Kit Pierson	Attending Sunwest preliminary approval hearing.	0.50	\$450	\$225.00	59
10/8/2010	Kit Pierson	Preparation for Sunwest preliminary approval hearing (including review of pleadings, Ninth Circuit decision regarding fees/objections, etc.).	2.20	\$450	\$990.00	59
10/15/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Review court's preliminary approval order	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
10/20/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Draft letter to clients	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	63
10/21/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Draft letter to clients	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	63
10/21/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with S. Walters re implementation of class action settlement.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
10/22/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise letter to clients	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	63
10/25/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Emails re: settlement	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	59
10/25/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare for and participate in conference calls re: claims administration	1.25	\$300	\$375.00	59
10/25/2010	Kit Pierson	Review time line projects for implementation of settlement and telephone conference with Messrs. Walters, Esler, Keppler et al regarding same.	0.60	\$450	\$270.00	59
10/28/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Research Rule 23(h) notice requirement; draft email to co-counsel and defense counsel about Rule 23(h)	1.75	\$300	\$525.00	52
10/29/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Email counsel re: Rule 23(h)	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	60
11/1/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Emails regarding class notice	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	59
11/2/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Research class notice issues	1.75	\$300	\$525.00	59

11/2/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Mr. Keppler re notice.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
11/2/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conferences with Messrs. Esler and Walters regarding same.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
11/2/2010	Kit Pierson	Review proposed notice changes and telephone conference with J. Kolsky regarding same.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
11/3/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Review motion to extend deadline	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
11/3/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Finalize class notice	2.00	\$300	\$600.00	59
11/4/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Emails re: class notice; review class notice	0.75	\$300	\$225.00	59
11/9/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Emails re: summary notice; finalize summary notice	1.25	\$300	\$375.00	59
11/10/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Emails re: settlement website	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	59
11/12/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Review fee petition to determine next steps	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
11/12/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Meet with Kit Pierson re: fee petition	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	60
11/12/2010	Kit Pierson	Review fees material; meeting with Mr. Kolsky regarding same.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	51
11/16/2010	Tyler Gaffney	Organizing case documents, filings, research. Updating self on current status of case	0.50	\$100	\$50.00	68
11/17/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Emails re: fee petition	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
11/17/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Research issue raised by class member re: claims bar order	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	52
11/18/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Research issues re: fee petition	1.00	\$300	\$300.00	51
11/19/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Email summary of fee petition issues; discuss with Kit Pierson	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
11/19/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Call with Mike Esler and Justine Fischer re: fee petition	1.00	\$300	\$300.00	60
11/22/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Emails and research re: fee petition	1.25	\$300	\$375.00	51
11/22/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Mike Esler re fee petition.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
11/22/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with H. Adelman re same.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
11/22/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with J. Fischer re same.	0.10	\$450	\$45.00	59
11/29/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Emails re: fee petition	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	60
11/29/2010	Kit Pierson	Preparation of fees petition.	5.50	\$450	\$2,475.00	59
11/29/2010	Steven Toll	Discussion with Kit Pierson re fee issues	0.25	\$450	\$112.50	60
11/30/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise fee petition	4.75	\$300	\$1,425.00	51
11/30/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with H. Adelman regarding fees and meeting with H. Adelman regarding fees declaration.	0.30	\$450	\$135.00	60
11/30/2010	Kit Pierson	Reviewing fees draft.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	59
12/1/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise fee petition memo; research issues relating to fee petition	2.50	\$300	\$750.00	51
12/1/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Meeting with Kit Pierson re: fee petition; request billing records	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
12/1/2010	Kit Pierson	Telephone conference with Grenley regarding class action settlement pleadings.	0.20	\$450	\$90.00	60
12/2/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Format time records for fee petition and send to Kit Pierson	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	60
12/2/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Begin drafting final approval memo	0.75	\$300	\$225.00	51
12/7/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Draft email re: fee petition filing date	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
12/9/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Draft final approval motion	1.50	\$300	\$450.00	60
12/10/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Continue drafting final approval motion	2.00	\$300	\$600.00	51
12/13/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Review edits to fee application	0.25	\$300	\$75.00	51
12/14/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise fee petition	0.50	\$300	\$150.00	51
12/14/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise final approval memo	3.75	\$300	\$1,125.00	51
12/15/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise final approval memo	2.50	\$300	\$750.00	51
12/15/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Revise time records for fee petition	2.00	\$300	\$600.00	51
12/16/2010	Joshua Kolsky	Prepare time records for fee petition; revise fee petition	5.00	\$300	\$1,500.00	51

**Total**

**\$661,780.00**