

EXHIBIT A

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal
Equity Receiver
The Grassmueck Group
P.O. Box 3649
Portland, OR 97208

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480486
Neil C. Gordon

For Legal Services Rendered In Connection With:

Client/Matter #23426-1

SEC v. Global Online Direct, Inc. (USDC-NDGA, No. 1:07-CV-0767-WSD)

05/24/07	D. Laddin	1.10	Reviewed all Global Online Direct pleadings forwarded by D. Zarro (.8); telephone conference with J. del Castillo regarding fee applications (.2); reviewed local rules (.1)
06/05/07	N. Gordon	0.20	Correspondence from and to David Zarro regarding receivership
06/08/07	D. Laddin	0.20	Reviewed receivership pleadings; conference with N. Gordon regarding status
06/11/07	D. Laddin	0.40	Reviewed receivership papers; telephone conference with D. Zarro regarding status and current issues in receivership, in addition to fee application
06/15/07	N. Gordon	0.20	Telephone conference with Aaron Lipson regarding receivership
06/29/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Telephone conference with J. DeCastillo regarding noticing issue
07/09/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Telephone conference with M. Grassmueck regarding fee application and status of case
07/17/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed proposed Consent Order among Behrmann, Hunter and SEC
10/26/07	D. Laddin	0.20	Reviewed docket in case with respect to pending motions (.2)
10/29/07	D. Laddin	0.40	Reviewed Hunter and Behrmann Consents and Judgments, and correspondence regarding same (.4)

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480486
Neil C. Gordon

Client/Matter #23426-1

01/07/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed status of various Global Online Direct matters (.1)
01/10/08	D. Nealy	0.50	Update pleadings index and file
01/22/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed chart with status of various receivership matters (.1)
03/05/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed incoming Global Online pleadings and order on fee application (.1)
03/19/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed incoming pleadings and orders in Global Online direct cases (.1)
03/24/08	D. Laddin	0.20	Reviewed incoming orders and motions in Global Online Direct
			Total Hours 4.10
			Total For Services \$1,724.50

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480486
Neil C. Gordon

Client/Matter #23426-1

Expenses:

To Westlaw for computerized research for 10/22/07	9.52
For filing fees paid to Clerk, United States District Court-filing fee-23426.1	350.00
Tracking #861313512878 From: ANDI GOSSMANN, ARNALL GOLDEN & GREGORY, 171 17TH ST NW STE 2100, ATLANTA, GA 303631031 To: JOSHUA DEL CASTILLO, ALLEN MATKINS ET AL, 515 S FIGUEROA ST 7TH FL, LOS ANGELES, CA 90071	41.68
For local delivery services provided by AQuick Delivery to Usdc/Clerk from Arnall Golden Gregory on 10/12/07. Invoice#97220, 10/14/07.	28.95
For local delivery services provided by AQuick Delivery to Arnall Golden Gregory from Usdc/Clerk on 10/12/07. Invoice#97220, 10/14/07.	16.95
For local delivery services provided by A Quick Delivery to USDC from Arnall Golden Gregory on 06/15/07. In# 90656, 06/18/07.	26.40
For local delivery services provided by A Quick Delivery to Arnall Golden Gregory from USDC on 06/15/07. In# 90656, 06/18/07.	17.40
For professional services paid to USDC NDGA for the filing of 9 pro hac vice application in the Global Online Direct case.	1,350.00
For special stenographic services incurred in the month of December	22.50
Telecommunications expense incurred	12.74
Total Expenses	\$1,876.14
Total This Statement	\$ 3,600.64

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480486
Neil C. Gordon

Client/Matter #23426-1

Attorney and Paralegal Summary

	Hours Worked	Billed Per Hour	Bill Amount
Laddin, Darryl S.	3.20	456.56	1,461.00
Gordon, Neil C.	0.40	465.00	186.00
Nealy, Devora L.	0.50	155.00	77.50
Total All Attorneys	4.10		1,724.50

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

EI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

**Arnall
Golden
Gregory LLP**

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity
Receiver
The Grassmueck Group
P.O. Box 3649
Portland, OR 97208

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480486
Neil C. Gordon

For Legal Services Rendered In Connection With:

Client/Matter #23426-1

Total this Statement \$ 3,600.64

Amount of Payment Enclosed \$ _____

**TO ENSURE YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED,
PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.**

Thank you!

REMITTANCE COPY

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEL# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501



Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal
Equity Receiver
The Grassmueck Group
P.O. Box 3649
Portland, OR 97208

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480481
Darryl S. Laddin

For Legal Services Rendered In Connection With:

Client/Matter #23426-2

Employment / Fees

06/14/07	D. Laddin	0.60	Reviewed and revised draft First Interim Fee Application and proposed Order
06/14/07	A. Chambliss	0.40	Review pro hac vice motions and begin revisions; create certificate of service for pro hac vice motions
06/14/07	A. Chambliss	1.00	Revise pro hac vice applications and First Interim Fee Application.
06/15/07	A. Chambliss	2.60	Revise and e-file First Interim Fee Application to include additional service parties; Revise and e-file pro hac vice motions for Joshua A. del Castillo and David Zarro; Prepare service copies and correspondence to all Counsel enclosing First Interim Fee Application, Order and pro hac vice applications
07/10/07	D. Laddin	0.40	Reviewed Global Online Direct docket; telephone conference with Chambers regarding Global Online Direct case; reviewed fee application
07/12/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed Order granting fee applications; correspondence regarding same
11/07/07	D. Laddin	0.30	Telephone conference with Judge Duffy's Chambers regarding civil actions and pro hac motions; reviewed incoming pleadings; correspondence regarding same
11/09/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Correspondence regarding pro hac applications in various actions

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 55-0543673

171 17th Street NW | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480481
Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-2

12/03/07	D. Laddin	1.10	Reviewed and revised final fee application of Monitor (.8); telephone conference with D. Zaro re fee application and other matters in case, including asset sales and civil litigation (.2); reviewed AGG time on receivership matter to be billed (.1)
12/07/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed Final Fee Application of Monitor, and correspondence re same (.1)
12/10/07	N. Overholtzer	0.60	Finalize fee application and file application and proposed order in District Court
12/10/07	D. Laddin	0.30	Attention to review and filing of final fee application (.3)
01/10/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed docket and motion to sell assets (.1)
02/01/08	D. Laddin	0.20	Correspondence regarding fee application, and reviewed same (.2)
		Total Hours	7.90
		Total For Services	\$2,242.50
		Total This Statement	\$ 2,242.50

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480481
Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-2

Attorney and Paralegal Summary

	Hours Worked	Billed Per Hour	Bill Amount
Laddin, Darryl S.	3.30	453.18	1,495.50
Overholtzer, Nancy J.	0.60	145.00	87.00
Chambliss, Angela O.	4.00	165.00	660.00
Total All Attorneys	7.90		2,242.50

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

**Arnall
Golden
Gregory LLP**

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity
Receiver
The Grassmueck Group
P.O. Box 3649
Portland, OR 97208

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480481
Darryl S. Laddin

For Legal Services Rendered In Connection With:

Client/Matter #23426-2

Total this Statement \$ 2,242.50

Amount of Payment Enclosed \$ _____

**TO ENSURE YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED,
PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.**

Thank you!

REMITTANCE COPY

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal
Equity Receiver
The Grassmueck Group
P.O. Box 3649
Portland, OR 97208

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480482
Darryl S. Laddin

For Legal Services Rendered In Connection With:

Client/Matter #23426-3

Investigation and Reporting

07/20/07	D. Laddin	0.70	Telephone conference with J. Del Castillo regarding filing of Receiver's report; reviewed Receiver's Report; telephone conferences with J. Del Castillo regarding same; conference with A. Chambliss regarding same
07/20/07	A. Chambliss	3.10	Revise and finalize Preliminary Report of Receiver, Michael A. Grammueck; Gather and organize exhibit attachments to Preliminary Report of Receiver; electronically file with the Northern District of Georgia the Preliminary Report of Receiver; prepare letter to all Counsel regarding same; prepare service copies of same for delivery to all Counsel
01/17/08	D. Laddin	0.20	Reviewed draft of Interim Receiver Report (.2)
01/22/08	D. Laddin	0.20	Attention to review of and filing of Receiver's Report (.2)
04/03/08	D. Laddin	0.50	Reviewed Receiver's forensic accountant's report, and prepared it for filing (.5)
04/04/08	D. Nealy	1.50	Review and revise and electronically file receivers forensic accountants report dated march 31, 2008 with the court and prepare service of same
04/04/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Revised accountant's report (.1)

Total Hours 6.30

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEIN# 58-0543673

171 17th Street NW | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480482
Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-3

Total For Services \$1,544.00

Total This Statement \$ 1,544.00

Attorney and Paralegal Summary

	Hours Worked	Billed Per Hour	Bill Amount
Laddin, Darryl S.	1.70	470.59	800.00
Chambliss, Angela O.	3.10	165.00	511.50
Nealy, Devora L.	1.50	155.00	232.50
Total All Attorneys	6.30		1,544.00

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

**Arnall
Golden
Gregory LLP**

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity
Receiver
The Grassmueck Group
P.O. Box 3649
Portland, OR 97208

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480482
Darryl S. Laddin

For Legal Services Rendered In Connection With:

Client/Matter #23426-3

Total this Statement \$ 1,544.00

Amount of Payment Enclosed \$ _____

**TO ENSURE YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED,
PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.**

Thank you!

REMITTANCE COPY

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673
171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal
Equity Receiver
The Grassmueck Group
P.O. Box 3649
Portland, OR 97208

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480483
Darryl S. Laddin

For Legal Services Rendered In Connection With:

Client/Matter #23426-4

Investor Issues

08/20/07	A. Chambliss	3.40	Emails to and from Martha Diaz regarding documents to be filed in USDC; Review and revise Receiver's Application for Authorization to Notice Investors by Means of Electronic Mail, Receiver's Application to Employ Property Manager and Real Estate Broker and Proposed Orders for same; Prepare same for electronic filing; File documents with the USDC; Prepare letter to Counsel regarding same; Prepare service copies
10/17/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed issues relating to motions to dismiss complaints filed by investors
10/18/07	D. Laddin	0.20	Correspondence regarding Motions to Dismiss civil actions
10/18/07	F. White	0.60	Proofread pleadings and arrange with Angela Chambliss for motions to dismiss and accompanying papers to be filed and served; correspondence with Yale Kim regarding same
10/18/07	A. Chambliss	4.10	Revise and electronically file Motion to Dismiss, Request for Judicial Notice and Order for Lee, Krell, and Standifer.
10/29/07	D. Laddin	0.20	Reviewed Orders on Application to Employ Property Manager and Application for Authorization to Notice Investors, call to Judge Duffy's Chambers regarding same (.2)

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street NW | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmuck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480483
Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-4

10/30/07	D. Laddin	0.40	Reviewed property manager and investor motions/orders; telephone conference with Chambers regarding same; correspondence regarding same
11/05/07	D. Laddin	0.20	Reviewed Court's Order on notice procedures, requesting additional briefing; correspondence regarding same
11/06/07	D. Laddin	0.30	Reviewed open matters, including notice order issues; call to D. Zarro regarding same; reviewed Behrmann and Hunter judgments; reviewed Standifer and Krell motions for extensions; correspondence regarding same
11/07/07	D. Laddin	0.30	Telephone conference with Judge Duffy's Chambers regarding civil actions and pro hac motions; reviewed incoming pleadings; correspondence regarding same
11/09/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Correspondence regarding pro hac applications in various actions
11/12/07	A. Chambliss	4.50	Finalize pro hac applications in the Le, Krell, and Standifer cases; e-file pro hac applications of David Zarro and Yale Kim, and prepare service copies for mailing.
11/13/07	A. Chambliss	3.10	Finalize and email pro hac applications for Joshua del Castillo, Mark Hartney, and David Zarro in the SEC case.
11/14/07	D. Laddin	0.30	Reviewed incoming pleadings and correspondence regarding pro hac motions in various cases (.2); reviewed motion for extension filed by Le, and correspondence regarding same (.1)
11/19/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Correspondence regarding supplemental briefing (.1)
11/20/07	D. Laddin	0.40	Reviewed draft supplemental Brief on notice procedures and affidavit regarding notice procedures
11/21/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed Supplemental Brief on notice issues, and attended to filing

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480483
Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-4

11/30/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed Order and Opinion granting noticing procedures Motion, and correspondence regarding same
12/03/07	D. Laddin	0.60	Reviewed other incoming pleadings in civil actions, and correspondence regarding same (.6)
12/04/07	D. Laddin	0.70	Reviewed Krell response to motion to dismiss his complaint (.1); attention to various matters relating to Motions to Dismiss, Responses and Replies to be filed, including deadline calculation, and correspondence regarding same (.4); correspondence regarding sale pleadings (.1); reviewed incoming pleadings on complaints filed against Receiver (.1)
12/05/07	D. Laddin	0.40	Reviewed e-filings regarding Motions to Dismiss, and call to Chambers regarding Motions to Dismiss (.1); reviewed status of various civil actions relating to receivership (.2); telephone conference with J. Birnbaum regarding Motions to Dismiss (.1)
12/10/07	D. Laddin	0.90	Reviewed pleadings and edited Replies for Le, Krell and Standifer, and telephone conference with Y. Kim regarding same (.9)
12/11/07	N. Overholtzer	0.60	File reply to response to motion to dismiss filed by Standifer et al (.2); file reply to response to motion to dismiss filed by Donovan LE (.2), file reply to response to motion to dismiss filed by Krell et al (.2)
12/11/07	D. Laddin	0.70	Finalized Krell, Standifer and Le Replies, attention to the filing of same, and correspondence regarding same
12/14/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed SEC Motion to Dismiss Krell Complaint (.1)
01/02/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed Standifer opposition to SEC Motion to Dismiss and other incoming Global Online Direct pleadings (.1)
01/14/08	D. Laddin	0.20	Telephone conference with I. Braich, and correspondence regarding I. Braich conversation (.2)

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480483
Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-4

02/20/08	D. Laddin	0.20	Reviewed various motions to intervene in SEC action (.2)	
02/22/08	D. Nealy	0.40	Prepare email correspondence for D. Laddin to forward to Y. Kim	
02/22/08	D. Laddin	0.30	Reviewed Orders and Judgments dismissing Krell, Le and Standifer actions, and correspondence regarding same (.3)	
04/10/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Telephone conference with K. Baldwin regarding investor question (.1)	
04/10/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed incoming pleadings in main Global Online Direct case, relating to intervention (.1)	
			Total Hours	23.90
			Total For Services	\$6,143.50
			Total This Statement	\$ 6,143.50

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480483
Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-4

Attorney and Paralegal Summary

	Hours Worked	Billed Per Hour	Bill Amount
White, Frank N.	0.60	380.00	228.00
Laddin, Darryl S.	7.20	454.86	3,275.00
Overholtzer, Nancy J.	0.60	145.00	87.00
Chambliss, Angela O.	15.10	165.00	2,491.50
Nealy, Devora L.	0.40	155.00	62.00
Total All Attorneys	23.90		6,143.50

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FBI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

**Arnall
Golden
Gregory LLP**

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity
Receiver
The Grassmueck Group
P.O. Box 3649
Portland, OR 97208

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480483
Darryl S. Laddin

for Legal Services Rendered In Connection With:

Client/Matter #23426-4

Total this Statement \$ 6,143.50

Amount of Payment Enclosed \$ _____

**TO ENSURE YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED,
PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.**

Thank you!

REMITTANCE COPY

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEIN 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

**Arnall
Golden
Gregory LLP**

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal
Equity Receiver
The Grassmueck Group
P.O. Box 3649
Portland, OR 97208

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480484
Darryl S. Laddin

For Legal Services Rendered In Connection With:

Client/Matter #23426-5

Asset Recovery / Disposition

08/20/07	D. Laddin	0.20	Reviewed Union Lumber proposed Consent Order; conference with A. Chambliss regarding filings to be made in District Court today; telephone conference with D. Zarro regarding today's filings and Union Lumber proposed Consent Order; correspondence regarding Union Lumber proposed Consent Order
08/24/07	D. Laddin	0.40	Reviewed and revised draft of Union Lumber Consent Order and Application; telephone conference with D. Zarro regarding same; telephone conference with A. Stadler regarding same; correspondence regarding same
09/04/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed Union Lumber Order entered by Court; correspondence regarding same
09/10/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed Nevada State Bank and Eastern Oregon Title subpoenas
09/20/07	D. Laddin	0.30	Reviewed Union Lumber Complaint and Motion to Stay Proceedings; correspondence regarding same
12/12/07	D. Laddin	2.30	Reviewed and revised draft of motion to sell assets, declarations and related pleadings and documents; telephone conference with Y. Kim regarding same

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street NW | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity
Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480484
Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-5

02/13/07	N. Overholtzer	5.40	File motion for order to sale assets at auction (.4); file notice of motion (.2); file declaration of Timothy Murphy and exhibit (.4); file declaration of Michael Grassmueck and exhibit (2.5); file proposed order and exhibits (1.5); memos to Y. Kim, c.c. D. Laddin with filed documents and exhibits (.4)
02/13/07	D. Laddin	1.90	Finalized Motion, Notice of Motion, Order, Declaration of Grassmueck, Declaration of Murphy and Exhibits and attention to filing of same, correspondence regarding same, and telephone conferences with Y. Kim regarding same (1.9)
02/18/07	D. Laddin	0.10	Attention to certificates of service for auction motion (.1)
01/02/08	D. Laddin	0.30	Reviewed Final Fee Application and Motion to Sell Assets, reviewed docket relating to same, and telephone conference with Judge Duffy's Chambers regarding same (.3)
01/04/08	D. Laddin	2.60	Reviewed pleadings relating to sale of real property, telephone conferences with Y. Kim regarding same, research on statutory and appraisal issues relating thereto, correspondence regarding same (2.6)
01/07/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Telephone conference with Y. Kim regarding real property sale motion (.1)
01/08/08	D. Laddin	0.60	Reviewed revisions to real property sale motion, and 28 USC section 2001/2002, and telephone conference with Y. Kim regarding same (.6)
01/14/08	D. Laddin	0.20	Reviewed inventory sale motion, reviewed docket relating to same, call to Chambers regarding same, and correspondence regarding same (.2)
01/15/08	D. Laddin	0.40	Reviewed correspondence from J. Birnbaum concerning asset sale motion, and correspondence regarding same (.1); telephone conference with D. Zaro regarding sale motion, jurisdiction issue and hearings (.3)
01/18/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed revisions to real property sale motion and related pleadings (.1)

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480484
Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-5

01/22/08	D. Laddin	0.70	Prepared for and telephonically attended hearing on inventory sale motion, and follow up call with D. Zaro (.7)
01/23/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed inventory sale order, and correspondence regarding same (.1)
02/19/08	D. Laddin	0.20	Telephone conference with D. Fennell regarding foreclosure on Higgenbottom property, and call to J. del Castillo regarding same (.2)
02/19/08	D. Laddin	0.20	Attention to incoming pleadings in various matters, and status of real estate motion and fraudulent conveyance action (.2)
02/20/08	D. Laddin	0.40	Correspondence re potential foreclosure of Global Online property (.1); reviewed latest draft of motion for approval of sale of real property, and related pleadings (.3)
02/21/08	D. Nealy	2.20	Review and discuss filing of Grassmueck motion for order authorizing sale in regards to real estate (.2); prepare and electronically file same and related documents with the court (2.0)
02/21/08	D. Laddin	1.10	Reviewed real property sale motion and related pleadings and documents, and prepared same for filing (1.1)
02/27/08	D. Nealy	0.40	Electronically file with the District Court of Georgia certificate of email notice and certificate of service of sale motion pleadings on investors and creditors and forward filed copies of same to Y. Kim
03/10/08	D. Laddin	0.20	Reviewed docket and real estate sale motion, and call to Chambers regarding entry of order on same (.2)
03/24/08	D. Nealy	0.30	Retrieve and forward Amended Order regarding Motion for Order Authorizing Auction Sale of Assets to D. Laddin
04/04/08	D. Nealy	0.50	Review and prepare sale motion in connection with the Lincoln and Beakman properties for electronic filing

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480484
Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-5

04/04/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed pleadings relating to Lincoln and Beakman properties (.1)
04/07/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed motion for sale of property to be filed (.1)
04/07/08	D. Nealy	1.00	Prepare motion, notice of motion, proposed order and certificate of service in connection with sale of Lincoln-Beakman properties for electronic filing
04/08/08	D. Nealy	0.40	Electronically file with the court, the Certificate of Service of sale motion pleadings in connection with the Lincoln-Beakman properties
04/10/08	D. Nealy	0.30	Electronically file certificate of sale motion pleadings on investors and creditors related to the Lincoln-Beakman properties
04/10/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed certificate of service of real property sale motion, and correspondence regarding same (.1)

Total Hours 23.40

Total For Services \$7,641.00

Total This Statement \$ 7,641.00

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FBI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480484
Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-5

Attorney and Paralegal Summary

	Hours Worked	Billed Per Hour	Bill Amount
Laddin, Darryl S.	12.90	470.35	6,067.50
Overholtzer, Nancy J.	5.40	145.00	783.00
Nealy, Devora L.	5.10	155.00	790.50
Total All Attorneys	23.40		7,641.00

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

**Arnall
Golden
Gregory LLP**

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity
Receiver
The Grassmueck Group
P.O. Box 3649
Portland, OR 97208

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480484
Darryl S. Laddin

For Legal Services Rendered In Connection With:

Client/Matter #23426-5

Total this Statement \$ 7,641.00

Amount of Payment Enclosed \$ _____

**TO ENSURE YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED,
PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.**

Thank you!

REMITTANCE COPY

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEIN 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal
Equity Receiver
The Grassmueck Group
P.O. Box 3649
Portland, OR 97208

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480485
Darryl S. Laddin

For Legal Services Rendered In Connection With:

Client/Matter #23426-7

Fraudulent Conveyance

10/11/07	F. White	0.80	Telephone conference with Josh del Castillo regarding assistance needed with filing of complaint in N.D.Ga.; call to Andi Gossman to submit filing fee check request; draft correspondence and forward civil cover sheet form to Josh del Castillo; follow-up correspondence to Josh del Castillo; begin review of draft complaint
10/12/07	F. White	1.80	Review and provide comments on draft complaint; complete civil cover sheet and supervise completion of summonses; various preparations for filing of complaint and correspondence and calls with Josh del Castillo and Andi Gossman
10/12/07	A. Gossman	1.50	Interoffice conference and multiple emails with Frank White and clients; draft and finalize Civil Cover Sheet, Summonses and Complaint; prepare same for filing; file same
10/16/07	D. Laddin	0.20	Reviewed fraudulent transfer complaint
10/25/07	D. Laddin	0.50	Reviewed fraudulent conveyance complaint; reviewed SEC v. Ross decision; telephone conference with J. Del Castillo regarding service; telephone conference with A. Black regarding service
10/26/07	D. Laddin	0.30	Telephone conference with D. Zarro, M. Grassmueck regarding pending motions, fraudulent conveyance, and asset sales (.3)

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEIN# 58-0543673

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480485
Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-7

12/04/07	D. Laddin	0.40	Reviewed Court's instructions to litigants in Grassmueck v. Hunter (.2); reviewed Hunter Answer (.2)
12/07/07	D. Laddin	0.60	Reviewed Preliminary Report, discovery and scheduling issues relating to Hunter fraudulent conveyance matter, and telephone conference with J. delCastillo regarding same (.6)
12/13/07	D. Laddin	0.60	Attention to matters relating to 26(f) Report and Initial Disclosures for Hunter matter, correspondence regarding same and telephone conference with J. DelCastillo regarding same (.6)
12/14/07	D. Laddin	1.90	Attention to Joint Certificate of Interested Persons for Hunter matter (.1); reviewed and revised Certificate of Service for sale motion pleadings (.1); attention to all files relating to receivership (.5); reviewed Hunter fraudulent conveyance pleadings and related information needed for 26(f) conference (.6); 26(f) conference in Hunter action with M. Hartney, J. delCastillo, B. Leonard (.5); telephone conference with J. delCastillo regarding Hunter 26(f) Report and Initial Disclosures (.2)
12/18/07	D. Laddin	2.00	Drafted 26(f) Report, reviewed pleadings and documents relating to same, and correspondence regarding same (1.7); reviewed standards for motion to compel compliance with subpoena and forward forms to Y. Kim (.3)
12/19/07	D. Laddin	0.20	Telephone conference with J. delCastillo regarding Initial Disclosures and 26(f) Report (.2)
12/20/07	D. Laddin	0.40	Reviewed, revised and correspondence regarding 26(f) Report (.4)
01/02/08	D. Laddin	1.20	Correspondence regarding 26(f) Report, telephone conference with J. delCastillo regarding 26(f) Report and discovery, reviewed final 26(f) Report, telephone conference with B. Leonard regarding final 26(f) Report (.4); reviewed Statement of Interested Persons, telephone conference with J. delCastillo regarding same, and correspondence regarding same (.2); finalized Initial Disclosures for filing, and correspondence regarding same (.6)

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FBI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480485
Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-7

01/03/08	D. Laddin	0.50	Reviewed as-filed 26(f) Report and Statement of Interested Parties in Hunter matter, and correspondence regarding same (.3); reviewed jurisdictional issue, and correspondence regarding same (.2)
01/08/08	D. Laddin	0.20	Reviewed Hunter discovery issue, telephone conference with J. delCastillo regarding same, correspondence regarding same (.2)
01/14/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed Hunter correspondence, and telephone conference with J. delCastillo regarding Hunter discovery (.1)
01/15/08	D. Laddin	0.60	Reviewed correspondence from J. Birnbaum concerning Hunter jurisdiction issue, and correspondence regarding same (.3); telephone conference with J. delCastillo regarding conferences with Court and jurisdiction issue (.2); correspondence regarding jurisdiction issue (.1)
01/16/08	D. Laddin	1.30	Correspondence regarding fraudulent conveyance and inventory sale hearing issues (.2); reviewed Joint Pretrial Order and related caselaw with respect to subject matter and personal jurisdiction arguments of defendants, and telephone conference with J. delCastillo regarding same (1.1)
01/17/08	D. Laddin	1.30	Reviewed Initial Disclosures and document production from B. Leonard in Hunter fraudulent conveyance matter, and correspondence regarding same (.2); telephonic conference with Court on Hunter jurisdiction issue, telephone conference with J. delCastillo regarding same, and correspondence regarding same (.5); telephone conferences with M. Hartney, J. delCastillo regarding conference with Court on Hunter jurisdiction issue (.3); second telephonic conference with Court on Hunter jurisdiction issue, and follow-up call with M. Hartney and B. Leonard (.3)
01/18/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed Scheduling Order entered by Court in Hunter fraudulent conveyance action, and correspondence regarding same (.1)
01/25/08	D. Laddin	0.20	Reviewed discovery request forms, and correspondence regarding same (.2)

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FBI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity Receiver

May 30, 2008
 Invoice #480485
 Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-7

03/04/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Correspondence regarding Hickenbottom settlement offer (.1)
03/26/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed correspondence regarding Hunter fraudulent conveyance settlement proposal and discovery (.1)
04/01/08	D. Laddin	0.10	Reviewed discovery served by defendants in Hunter action
04/17/08	D. Laddin	0.20	Correspondence regarding motion to amend complaint in Hunter matter, and reviewed requirements for motion (.2)
04/30/08	D. Laddin	0.30	Correspondence regarding extension of Hunter discovery period, and reviewed form of motion (.2); telephone conference with J. delCastillo re Hunter discovery period extension (.1)

Total Hours 17.50

Total For Services \$7,478.50

Total This Statement \$ 7,478.50

Attorney and Paralegal Summary

	Hours Worked	Billed Per Hour	Bill Amount
White, Frank N.	2.60	380.00	988.00
Laddin, Darryl S.	13.40	466.46	6,250.50
Gossmann, Andrea M.	1.50	160.00	240.00
Total All Attorneys	17.50		7,478.50

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

Grasmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity
Receiver

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480485
Darryl S. Laddin

Client/Matter #23426-7

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FEI# 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501

**Arnall
Golden
Gregory LLP**

Grassmueck, Michael, in his capacity as Corporate Monitor and Federal Equity
Receiver
The Grassmueck Group
P.O. Box 3649
Portland, OR 97208

May 30, 2008
Invoice #480485
Darryl S. Laddin

For Legal Services Rendered In Connection With:

Client/Matter #23426-7

Total this Statement \$ 7,478.50

Amount of Payment Enclosed \$ _____

**TO ENSURE YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED,
PLEASE RETURN THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.**

Thank you!

REMITTANCE COPY

A LATE CHARGE OF 1-1/2% PER MONTH WILL BE APPLIED TO BALANCES OUTSTANDING OVER 60 DAYS

FBI/ 58-0543673

171 17th Street | Suite 2100 | Atlanta, GA 30363-1031 | 404.873.8500 | Fax: 404.873.8501