

# EXHIBIT A

## Justine Fischer -- Time Records

<u>Date</u>	<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Description</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Code</u>
1/28/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Steve Toll re: acting as local counsel in class action suit against Davis Wright	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
1/29/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson about Davis Wright class action suit related to Sunwest	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	60
1/30/2009	Justine Fischer	Review draft complaint in class action against DWT; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: suggested revisions to same	1.20	\$400	\$480.00	51
2/2/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Herb Adelman re: claims vs. DWT, documents from Wielde; other lawsuits and potential lawsuits related to DWT's role, 30-day letter and clients; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: complaint formatting issues	1.30	\$400	\$520.00	60
2/18/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Herb Adelman re: complaint and documents from Wielde in custody of the state	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	60
2/24/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: status of Esler and Yugler's cases against DWT, need for OJIN search and Judge Roberts' ruling	0.60	\$400	\$240.00	60
2/25/2009	Justine Fischer	Conduct OJIN search for DWT cases; review files at Multnomah County Circuit Court; review Judge Roberts' ruling, review Esler and Yugler complaints; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: same	2.10	\$400	\$840.00	52
2/26/2009	Justine Fischer	Review drafts of complaint; file final of complaint; e-mail to co-counsel re: same; draft summonses	2.50	\$400	\$1,000.00	51
3/2/2009	Justine Fischer	Conference with Herb Adelman; telephone conference with Joe Arellano re: acceptance of service; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: next steps (complex designation); complete acceptance of service form and summons	2.90	\$400	\$1,160.00	60
3/3/2009	Justine Fischer	Send out acceptance of service; review SEC Complaint and TRO request; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: same	1.40	\$400	\$560.00	60
3/4/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Herb Adelman re: Wielde documents and status	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	60
3/5/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Dennis Dupre, investor re: status of our case and his claims and negotiations	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	63
3/6/2009	Justine Fischer	Exchange e-mail with Kit Pierson re: Dupre and Kahn; e-mail with Jeff Manning re: our complaint against DWT	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	60
3/11/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Jack Platten, attorney for Wielde re: getting documents from the state of Oregon re: Wielde's offering docs	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
3/12/2009	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail from Jack Platten re: Wielde documents; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: same and invoice; call to Bonnie Richardson's office re: documents	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
3/13/2009	Justine Fischer	Call to Gary Kahn re: his case	0.10	\$400	\$40.00	60

3/16/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conferences with Caroline Smith of Securities division re: copying Wielde documents and likely costs of same	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	52
3/27/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: strategy	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
3/30/2009	Justine Fischer	Exchange e-mail with Kit Pierson re: trip to Oregon and meetings; telephone conference with Joe Arellano re: meeting with Kit Pierson	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	60
4/3/2009	Justine Fischer	Meeting with Kit Pierson to discuss strategy; telephone conference with co-counsel re: same (1.0); meeting with Arellano and Keppler to discuss next steps; conference with Grenley to discuss status of Hogan negotiations, his clients and working together	2.90	\$400	\$1,160.00	60
4/6/2009	Justine Fischer	Call to presiding court re: time for meeting on complex case designation; telephone conference with Joe Arellano re: same	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
4/7/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with co-counsel re: strategy and complex case designation; e-mail exchange with Esler re: same; forward pro hac vice forms to co-counsel; telephone conference with presiding court clerk re: scheduling	1.00	\$400	\$400.00	60
4/17/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Steve Walters re: status, relationship or receiver's case to class action; e-mail with Kit Pierson re: conversation with Walters	0.60	\$400	\$240.00	60
4/20/2009	Justine Fischer	Review letter from Keppler to Judge Mauer re: case management	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	60
4/21/2009	Justine Fischer	Draft cover letter for pro hac vice motion and materials for Circuit Court; conference with Judge Mauer re: assignment and complex case designation with Esler, Yugler, Stephens and Arellano and Keppler	0.90	\$400	\$360.00	51
5/1/2009	Justine Fischer	Review defendant's document requests to class; forward e-mail to co-counsel	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	54
5/1/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference call with Kit Pierson and Josh Devore re: strategy related to other third party claims and proposed schedule for class action; telephone conference with Judge LeBarre's assistant re: scheduling telephone conference with Joe Arellano re: same	1.70	\$400	\$680.00	60
5/5/2009	Justine Fischer	Conferences with Kit Pierson and with Pierson and Gary Grenley re: strategy and working together on class action and class issues; conference call with other co-counsel in Washington re: strategy and conflicts issues	2.30	\$400	\$920.00	60
5/6/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conferences and conference with Kit Pierson re: strategy for meeting with Judge LaBarre and scheduling of class action motions, etc.; conference with Judge LaBarre re: class issues; relationship to other DWT cases and receiver actions, if any	3.00	\$400	\$1,200.00	60
5/7/2009	Justine Fischer	Review amended complaint in Esler's case	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	52
5/13/2009	Justine Fischer	Review draft document request to DWT; e-mail suggested changes to Kit Pierson re: same	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	54
5/14/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: discovery	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	60

5/15/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: strategy on receivership case; find and forward federal pro hac vice forms	0.50	\$400	\$200.00	60
5/18/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: SEC case and strategy	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
5/19/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conferences with Kit Pierson re: intervention in SEC case and draft motion to intervene and content of opposition	0.50	\$400	\$200.00	60
5/20/2009	Justine Fischer	Review receiver's proposed motion on third party claims; telephone conferences with Kit Pierson re: same and intervention	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	51
5/21/2009	Justine Fischer	Review final motion to intervene and file same electronically in SEC case	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	51
5/26/2009	Justine Fischer	Review draft Opposition to SEC motion on third party claims; review e-mail from Velure via Grenley re: mediation meeting	0.70	\$400	\$280.00	51
5/27/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: opposition to plan and Velure e-mail; review final opposition and file same electronically	0.90	\$400	\$360.00	60
6/6/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Herb Adelman and Kit Pierson re: strategy and mediation	1.00	\$400	\$400.00	60
6/8/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conferences and e-mail exchanges with Kit Pierson re: schedule and re: SEC enforcement powers and discovery of absent class members; legal research on SEC enforcement powers and discovery from absent class members	1.20	\$400	\$480.00	60
6/9/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference and exchange e-mail with Kit re: attorneys' fees in Oregon class actions and strategy; legal research re: same	1.10	\$400	\$440.00	60
6/10/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: mediation issues; attend mediation session at Bullivant Hauser with Velure et al.	1.60	\$400	\$640.00	60
6/12/2009	Justine Fischer	Legal research on attorneys' fees in Oregon class actions; exchange e-mail with Kit Pierson re: same; review Grenley letter to Hogan; review draft amended complaint	1.10	\$400	\$440.00	52
6/12/2009		Conferences with Kit Pierson re: mediation strategy	1.30	\$400	\$520.00	60
6/12/2009		Conference with Steve English re: mediation strategy and other third party case	1.50	\$400	\$600.00	60
6/12/2009		Attend status conference with Judge Hogan and meeting with Osias and Valure on mediation Agreement	2.50	\$400	\$1,000.00	
6/17/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conferences with Grenley and Trincero and Steve English re: order and mediation; review and exchange e-mail with Kit Pierson and Grenley re: same; review revised orders and exchange e-mail with Osias; multiple telephone conferences with Kit Pierson re: strategy on mediation order	2.50	\$400	\$1,000.00	60
6/18/2009	Justine Fischer	Review draft demand letter	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	54
6/19/2009	Justine Fischer	Review draft schedule / proposed litigation plan for LaBarre; review e-mail exchange on meeting to coordinate for mediation; review letter to Velure; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: mediation	0.90	\$400	\$360.00	60
6/24/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: strategy on mediation role	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	60

6/25/2009	Justine Fischer	E-mail and file amended complaint in class action	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	51
6/26/2009	Justine Fischer	Exchange e-mail with Kit Pierson re: amended complaint and status conference with LaBarre; attend status conference with LaBarre re: scheduling of trial; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: same	2.00	\$400	\$800.00	60
7/2/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: strategy; review e-mail on meeting with Velure	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
7/7/2009	Justine Fischer	Conference with Kit Pierson re: strategy on mediation role	1.00	\$400	\$400.00	60
7/7/2009	Justine Fischer	Meeting with other plaintiffs and receiver counsel re: mediation strategy and roles	1.50	\$400	\$600.00	60
7/7/2009	Justine Fischer	Meeting with Velure and English re: mediation	0.70	\$400	\$280.00	
7/8/2009	Justine Fischer	Meeting with Grenley and Kit Pierson re: strategy	1.20	\$400	\$480.00	60
7/10/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: schedule for LaBarre case	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
7/14/2009	Justine Fischer	Exchange e-mail with Kit Pierson re: proposed schedule for LaBarre; review proposed schedule	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	60
7/31/2009	Justine Fischer	Meeting with Walters and Yugler, et al. and Kit Pierson to discuss strategy and interviews	2.00	\$400	\$800.00	60
8/5/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: strategy in mediation	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	60
8/13/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference call to discuss mediation strategy; review Kit Pierson's language an reorganization plan; review e-mail on plan; telephone conference with Kit Pierson on reorganization plan and objections and strategy	1.80	\$400	\$720.00	60
8/15/2009	Justine Fischer	Conference call with receiver counsel and plaintiff counsel re: mediation and interview	0.80	\$400	\$320.00	60
8/26/2009	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail re; plan treatment of third party claims; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: same	0.80	\$400	\$320.00	60
9/1/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: strategy on plan objections and mediation	1.00	\$400	\$400.00	60
9/8/2009	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail from co-counsel re; plan; review revise and edit objections; conference calls with Kit Pierson and Dan Sigelman re; objections; telephone conference call with clients	1.20	\$400	\$480.00	51
9/9/2009	Justine Fischer	Review final objections; telephone conf. with Kit Pierson re; additions; file objections electronically; review objections from SEC and State of Oregon	2.10	\$400	\$840.00	51
9/10/2009	Justine Fischer	Review TIC objection re; third party claims from Grenley and Connolly and others; read Dienes' SEC testimony; telephone conference with Larkins re; scheduling and documents from receiver; e-mail to Pierson re: conversation with Larkins	1.70	\$400	\$680.00	51
9/11/2009	Justine Fischer	Attend Dienes interview; talk with Larkins and Kit Pierson re: scheduling; tel. conf with Pierson re; scheduling and interview	3.20	\$400	\$1,280.00	52

9/17/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone confs. with Kit Pierson re; strategy for mediation and argument on objections	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
9/18/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conferences with Pierson and Sigelman re; argument and re: mediation and Velure meeting; telephone conference with Larkin re; interview schedules; review e-mail re: Velure meeting; review reorg plan provisions on 3rd party claims for argument; file pro hac vice motion; read other objections to plan	2.40	\$400	\$960.00	60
9/20/2009	Justine Fischer	Prepare for argument by reading opposition and cases cited in brief; read receiver's reply; review various e-mail among counsel	3.50	\$400	\$1,400.00	71
9/21/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Grenley, Dean, Kit Pierson et al. re: argument and strategy and meeting with Velure; telephone conference with Dean re; plan treatment of litigation trust; complete review of case for argument	3.00	\$400	\$1,200.00	60
9/22/2009	Justine Fischer	Prepare for argument on 3rd party claims	1.50	\$400	\$600.00	71
9/23/2009	Justine Fischer	Travel to Eugene and return	4.00	\$400	\$1,600.00	68
9/23/2009	Justine Fischer	Attend hearing on plan or reorg	7.00	\$400	\$2,800.00	70
9/23/2009	Justine Fischer	Meeting with Kit to discuss mediation strategy	0.60	\$400	\$240.00	60
9/24/2009	Justine Fischer	Travel to Eugene and return	4.00	\$400	\$1,600.00	68
9/24/2009	Justine Fischer	Mediation with plaintiffs and Harder counsel and Judge Velure	2.00	\$400	\$800.00	60
9/24/2009	Justine Fischer	Meeting with Dean, Jacoby and Pierson to discuss strategy	1.50	\$400	\$600.00	60
9/28/2009	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail from counsel re: interview for DWT mediation	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	52
9/29/2009	Justine Fischer	Conference with Kit Pierson re: strategy for meeting with receiver and plaintiffs' counsel to plan mediation; read interview write-up by Dean	0.70	\$400	\$280.00	60
9/30/2009	Justine Fischer	Meeting with Walters, Larkin, Stephens and Kit Pierson to try to resolve mediation strategy	2.00	\$400	\$800.00	60
9/30/2009	Justine Fischer	Conference with Kit Pierson re; result and strategy	0.50	\$400	\$200.00	60
10/1/2009	Justine Fischer	Work on writing up notes from Dienes interview	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	52
10/1/2009	Justine Fischer	Review revised redlined version of reorganization and distribution plan as it relates to third-party claims	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	52
10/2/2009	Justine Fischer	Review Judge Hogan's order approving plan; exchange e-mail with co-counsel re; plan approval and appellate issues; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: same	0.50	\$400	\$200.00	51
10/6/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone calls to clerk and to Deborah Wilhelm re: transcript for October 2 hearing; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: mediation and strategy on appeal; telephone conference call with other plaintiff counsel re: mediation	1.50	\$400	\$600.00	51
10/7/2009	Justine Fischer	Review transcript of October 2 hearing re: treatment of third-party claims; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: mediation and appellate rules and appealability of court approval in light of transcript; review receivers opposition to emergency stay	1.10	\$400	\$440.00	52

10/8/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: mediation status and strategy	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	60
10/9/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: claim form and mediation; exchange e-mail with Kit Pierson re: same	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
10/13/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re; mediation strategy	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
10/14/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: mediation status	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
10/14/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Lauren Ngu re: her clients claims and status and possible appear and status of third party claims assignment	0.70	\$400	\$280.00	60
10/15/2009	Justine Fischer	Travel to Eugene and return for mediation	4.00	\$400	\$1,600.00	68
10/15/2009	Justine Fischer	Meet with all plaintiffs counsel to discuss strategy on the issues of receiver's share of settlement; attend mediation completion	4.40	\$400	\$1,760.00	51
10/19/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference call with Kit Pierson and client re: settlement; review Grenley letter to clients	0.90	\$400	\$360.00	59
10/23/2009	Justine Fischer	Attend status conference with Judge LaBarre; conference with Arellano, Esler and Yugler re: possible form of settlement	0.60	\$400	\$240.00	70
11/11/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conferences with Kit Pierson re: class action issues on limiting opt outs in federal and state proceedings; review Ortiz case; legal research on ORCP 32 non-opt out class	1.30	\$400	\$520.00	51
11/12/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with are llano, Keppler, Toll and Pierson re: class action as an option to settle all or part of cases; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: same	0.90	\$400	\$360.00	51
12/28/2009	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail from Keppler re: Motion to Clarify settlement; review transcript of settlement	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	51
12/29/2009	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: Motion by DWT to clarify and review draft of same	0.50	\$400	\$200.00	51
12/30/2009	Justine Fischer	Review Motion to Clarify in final	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	51
1/6/2010	Justine Fischer	Review letter from Steve Walters re: settlement and SEC; exchange e-mail with Kit Pierson re: status conference in Multnomah County Circuit Court	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	59
1/14/2010	Justine Fischer	Review draft settlement agreement from DWT's counsel	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	59
1/15/2010	Justine Fischer	Participate in conference call with parties to cases before Judge LaBarre re: upcoming status conference and status of settlement; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: draft settlement agreement; attend status conference before Judge LaBarre	1.70	\$400	\$680.00	71
1/25/2010	Justine Fischer	Review revised settlement agreement draft; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: same	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	59
1/26/2010	Justine Fischer	Exchange e-mail with Kit Pierson re: settlement agreement draft	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	58
2/4/2010	Justine Fischer	Review changes to settlement agreement draft	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	59
2/5/2010	Justine Fischer	Telephone conferences with Kit Pierson re: revised draft of agreement and timing; review e-mail from Arellano, Esler and Velure re: same	0.60	\$400	\$240.00	59
2/9/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail re: cancellation of hearing on Motion to Clarify	0.10	\$400	\$40.00	51

2/10/2010	Justine Fischer	Participate in conference call among plaintiffs' counsel re; revised settlement language and remaining issues	0.60	\$400	\$240.00	60
2/12/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail from Stewart re: settlement issues and redlined draft and e-mail from Velure	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	58
2/16/2010	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re; hold back provisions and opt outs and disclosures; review e-mailed Esler's revisions to settlement agreement and Walters' addition on limitation of funds to Receiver	0.70	\$400	\$280.00	60
2/19/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail from Kit Pierson to Stewart, Walters et al re: hold back provisions and proposed language	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	60
2/24/2010	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with plaintiffs' counsel re; schedule and status conference with LaBarre	0.50	\$400	\$200.00	60
2/26/2010	Justine Fischer	Participate in status conference for Multnomah County Circuit Court cases; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: same	0.80	\$400	\$320.00	70
3/19/2010	Justine Fischer	Review "final" settlement documents as forwarded to Judge Velure by Arellano; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re; same	0.50	\$400	\$200.00	58
3/21/2010	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson and Esler re; problems with settlement documents and possible actions	0.90	\$400	\$360.00	60
3/22/2010	Justine Fischer	Telephone conferences with Kit Pierson and with Pierson and Stewart and Esler and with Pierson and Walters re; issues related to timing, hold back for opt outs and other issues with agreement as drafted; review e-mail from David Dean re; issues related to settlement agreement	2.70	\$400	\$1,080.00	60
3/25/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail related to dismissal language and e-mail from Jacoby re: ethical issues on advising clients and other issues between and among plaintiffs' counsel re: settlement agreement as drafted	1.10	\$400	\$440.00	58
3/26/2010	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: issues on dismissal and reinstatement and language to achieve it and ethics issues; telephone conference with all plaintiffs' counsel re: same	0.80	\$400	\$320.00	60
3/30/2010	Justine Fischer	Exchange e-mail with Kit Pierson re; negotiations on changes to draft agreement and status	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
3/31/2010	Justine Fischer	Review revised language of judgment and exchange e-mail with Kit Pierson re: same	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	51
4/1/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail on status and changes to settlement agreement	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	58
4/6/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail from Keppler re: logistic of getting the agreement executed	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	58
4/7/2010	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re; changes to agreement and next steps that we need to take re: federal class action	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	60
4/9/2010	Justine Fischer	Review letter to clients from Kit Pierson re: settlement	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	58



4/12/2010	Justine Fischer	Read settlement agreement and attachments in prep for telephone conference with client; telephone conference with Kit Pierson and Kurtz re: settlement terms and what he needs to do and participation in federal suit	1.20	\$400	\$480.00	58
4/14/2010	Justine Fischer	Exchange e-mail with Kit Pierson re: clients' reactions to settlement details	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	60
4/20/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail from Pierson to Walters re: schedule and documents necessary to get class settlement approved	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
4/24/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail from Kit Pierson re: status of clients signing on to agreements	0.10	\$400	\$40.00	58
4/26/2010	Justine Fischer	Review draft complaint in federal class action and mark up same	0.70	\$400	\$280.00	51
5/4/2010	Justine Fischer	Exchange e-mail with Kit Pierson and review e-mail from Keppler and Esler re: status conference with Judge LaBarre	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	71
5/7/2010	Justine Fischer	Participate in status conference before Judge LaBarre; telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: same	0.70	\$400	\$280.00	70
5/10/2010	Justine Fischer	Review latest draft of federal class action complaint	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	51
5/12/2010	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: class definition; review e-mail from Esler re: same	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	60
5/17/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail from Kit Pierson to Esler re: Esler's draft complaint; telephone conference with Kit re: strategy and class definitions and duty to class members and other cases	0.60	\$400	\$240.00	51
5/18/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail about class reps	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	51
5/24/2010	Justine Fischer	Review draft memo and order on abatement from Keppler re: class issues	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	51
5/26/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail from Pierson to Esler confirming respective roles in federal class action	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	60
5/28/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail re; CAFA notice and class complaint as filed	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	51
6/1/2010	Justine Fischer	Exchange e-mail with Keppler re: changes to documents to be filed with LaBarre; review answer filed by DWT in Federal Class case	0.50	\$400	\$200.00	51
6/7/2010	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: issues related to class settlement documents	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
6/9/2010	Justine Fischer	Review revision to class notice re; issues related to class definition and valid claims	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	58
6/10/2010	Justine Fischer	Conference call with Esler and Kit Pierson re: class notice and revisions to same and other class documents; review Esler's proposed revisions	0.70	\$400	\$280.00	60
6/23/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail from Kit Pierson re: coordination with Receiver on timing of class documents	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	58
7/6/2010	Justine Fischer	Review revised class documents	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	58
7/7/2010	Justine Fischer	Exchange e-mail with co-counsel re: e-filing of class documents	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	58

7/9/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail from Kit Pierson re; telephone conferences with clients; and exchange e-mail with co-counsel re: revisions to joint motion and formatting issues; e-file class documents	1.10	\$400	\$440.00	51
7/12/2010	Justine Fischer	Review Keppler's e-mail about revising and refiling class notice	0.2	\$400	\$80.00	51
7/19/2010	Justine Fischer	E-file pro hac vice papers for Kit Pierson and Josh Kolsky	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	51
7/22/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail re; schedule for hearing on preliminary approval	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	71
7/23/2010	Justine Fischer	Review e-mail on filing amended class documents because of DWT's changes to Notice	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	51
7/26/2010	Justine Fischer	E-filed and arrange to file hard copy of document under seal for amended class notice	0.50	\$400	\$200.00	51
7/27/2010	Justine Fischer	Exchange e-mail with Keppler re: filing opt out agreement under seal and revise draft letter to AG's offices	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	51
8/2/2010	Justine Fischer	Review Keppler's e-mail re: scheduling of preliminary approval hearing and review CAFA notice	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	51
8/10/2010	Justine Fischer	Review Court's order on fees for professionals	0.10	\$400	\$40.00	51
8/13/2010	Justine Fischer	Review Court order on scheduling telephone hearing on class settlement approval	0.10	\$400	\$40.00	51
8/20/2010	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: fee petition and Court's order on fees for professionals	0.40	\$400	\$160.00	60
8/31/2010	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: fee issue and clarification of Judge's order	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
9/1/2010	Justine Fischer	Review draft of Motion by Esler for clarification of Court's order on filing for professional fees	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	51
9/2/2010	Justine Fischer	Review revised motion by Esler re: clarification	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	51
9/23/2010	Justine Fischer	Exchange e-mail with Kit Pierson re: postponement of preliminary approval hearing	0.20	\$400	\$80.00	60
10/7/2010	Justine Fischer	Telephone conference with Kit Pierson re: hearing on preliminary approval of settlement	0.30	\$400	\$120.00	60
10/8/2010	Justine Fischer	Travel to Eugene and return to Portland for hearing on preliminary approval of settlement	4.00	\$400	\$1,600.00	68
10/8/2010	Justine Fischer	Hearing on preliminary approval of settlement	0.50	\$400	\$200.00	70
<b>Total</b>					<b>\$62,160.00</b>	

**Justine Fischer -- Expenses**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Amount</b>
2/28/2009	Office photocopies @ \$.10	\$43.00
3/30/2009	Messenger	\$8.00
3/30/2009	Long distance telephone charges	\$0.71
4/30/2009	Long distance telephone charges	\$0.10
4/30/2009	Postage	\$0.42
4/30/2009	Office photocopies @ \$.10	\$0.40
5/31/2009	Office photocopies @ \$.10	\$15.80
5/31/2009	Postage	\$11.97
5/31/2009	Long distance telephone charges	\$7.39
6/30/2009	Long distance telephone charges	\$0.80
6/30/2009	Office photocopies @ \$.10	\$13.20
6/30/2009	Postage	\$0.44
6/30/2009	Long distance telephone charges	\$2.37
7/30/2009	Messenger	\$36.75
8/13/2009	Long distance telephone charges	\$1.36
8/25/2009	Messenger	\$16.00
9/15/2009	Long distance telephone charges	\$0.73
9/23/2009	Parking -- Eugene	\$3.50
9/23/2009	Round trip to Eugene for argument on Reogrg plan (235 miles)	\$129.25
9/24/2009	Parking -- Eugene	\$1.50
9/24/2009	Roundtrip Portland to Eugene	\$129.25
9/25/2009	Office photocopies @ \$.10	\$1.60
9/25/2009	Postage	\$0.78
10/8/2009	Transcript of telephone hearing on October 2, 2009	\$22.80
10/15/2009	Mileage from Portland to Eugene for mediation -- 235 miles roundtrip	\$129.25
10/16/2009	Long distance telephone charges	\$7.64
10/28/2009	Office photocopies @ \$.10	\$0.10
10/28/2009	Postage	\$0.44
11/13/2009	Long distance telephone charges	\$0.48
12/15/2009	Long distance telephone charges	\$0.58
1/6/2010	Long distance telephone charges	\$0.04

2/8/2010 Long distance telephone charges	\$0.60
4/16/2010 Long distance telephone charges	\$2.23
5/13/2010 Long distance telephone charges	\$2.28
6/14/2010 Long distance telephone charges	\$2.36
7/30/2010 Office photocopies @ \$.10	\$4.40
7/30/2010 Postage	\$8.05
8/15/2010 Long distance telephone charges	\$1.06
9/15/2010 Long distance telephone charges	\$0.12
10/8/2010 Mileage for round trip from Portland to Eugene	\$112.50
11/15/2010 Long distance telephone charges	\$1.00
<b>Total</b>	<b>\$721.25</b>